ORDINANCE NO.

An ordinance amending Article 3, Chapter IX of the Los Angeles Municipal Code
to reflect local administrative changes and incorporate by reference portions of the 2013
Edition of the California Residential Code (C.R.C.).

THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY OF L.OS ANGELES
DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 91.5.101 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to
read as follows:

SEC. 91.5.101. TITLE.

"“‘ﬁh%f@@gress anz:i%th%g accessory structures. In
addition to the L.A.R.C., Chapters T M““IA“““‘"“" 11B.17, 34,63:67,70,71,72, 81,89, 92, 93
and 96, and Section 3109 of the Los ”1 g Idi ;

nits complying with the requirements of Section 419 of
a de shall be permitted to be built as one- and two-family
dwellings or to es. Fire suppression required by Section 419.5 of the
California Buildin de when constructed under the California Residential Code
for one- and two-family dwellings shall conform to Section 903.3.1.3 of the
California Building Code.

2. Owner-occupied lodging houses with five or fewer guestrooms shall
be permitted to be built in accordance with the California Residential Code for
one- and two-family dwellings when equipped with a fire sprinkler system in
accordance with Section R313.



Sec. 2. Section 91.5.301.1.4 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to
read as follows:

91.5.301.1.4. Seismic Design Provisions For Buildings Constructed On Or Into
Slopes Steeper Than One Unit Vertical In Three Units Horizontal (33.3 Percent
Slope). The design and construction of new buildings and additions to existing
buildings when constructed on or into slopes steeper than one unit vertical in three units
horizontal (33.3 percent slope) shall comply with Section 91.1613.8 of the Los Angeles
Municipal Code.

Sec. 3. Section 91.5.301.2.2.3.56.1 of the LosAgt 55
in its entirety.

Sec. 4. Section 91.5.301.2.2.3.8 of the,
read as follows:

'7‘

"lonai Building Code and ASCE
7, except where the component ist iio.the structure and flexible
connections are provided between tf ociated ductwork, piping, and
conduit; and either T <

areas as estabiashed b %@ i 91.5.301.2(1) shall meet the provisions of Section R322.
Wood foundations shall be*”"desugned and installed in accordance with AF&PA PWF.

Sec. 8. Section 91.5.501.1 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to
read as follows:

91.5.501.1. Application. The provisions of this Division shall control the design and
construction of the floors for all buildings including the floors of attic spaces used to
house mechanical or plumbing fixtures and equipment. Mechanical or plumbing fixtures



and equipment shall be attached (or anchored) to the structure in accordance with
Section 91.5.301.2.2.3.8.

Sec. 7. Section 91.5.600 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to read
as follows:

SEC. 91.5.600. BASIC PROVISIONS,

Chapfer 6 of the C.R.C. is hereby adopted by reference with the EXCEPTIONS,
modifications and additions set forth below. Addlﬁzonaliy,g 602.10.9.1 from the 2013
California Building Code is not adopted.

read as foliows



TABLE 91.5.602.3(1) FASTENER SCHEDULE FOR STRUCTURAL MEMBERS

ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF BUILDING
ELEMENTS

NUMBER AND
TYPE OF
FASTENER® > *

SPACING OF
FASTENERS

Roof

Blocking between joists or rafters to
top plate, toe nail

3-8d (24" x 0.113")

2 |Ceiling joists to plate, toe nail 3-8d (2'/2" % 0.113") —
3 Ceiling joists not attached to parailel .
rafter, laps over partitions, face nail
Collar tie to rafter, face nail or 1'/;" x y
4 . 3-10d —
20 gage ridge strap
5 |Rafter or roof truss to plate, toe nail & '135 ) or 3-10d
ommon nails
i,
Roof rafters to ridge, valley ¢
6 ! .
rafters: toe nail face nail
7  |Built-up studs-face naiI 24" o.c.
g |Abutting studs‘&aff@n 12" oc.
corners, faceds
9 Built-up header 16" o.c. along each edge

spacer

16" o.c. along each edge

11 : '.:,\“_ =
IOd 3" x0. 128") 24" o.c.
13 10d (3" x 0.128™) 24" o.c.
14 |offset ofe 8-16d (3% x 0.135") —
lapped area
15 Poleplae to joRsgh 164 (35" x 0.135") 16" o.c,
16 Sole plate to joist or blocking at 3-164 (31 /5 % 0.135") 16" o.c.
braced wall panels
3-8d (2'/y" x 0 113")
17 {Stud to sole plate, toe nail or2-16d (34" x e
0.135M)
18 [Top or sole plate to stud, end nail 2-16d (3'/," x 0.135") —
19 Top plates, laps at corners and 2-10d (3" x 0.128") L

intersections, face nail




1" brace to each stud and plate, face | 2-8d (2'/," x 0.1 13"

20 nail 2 staples 1 3/4” P -
1" x 6" sheathing to each bearing, 2-8d (214" x 0.113")

21 . 3 S
face nail 2 staples 1°/4
1" x 8" sheathing to each bearing, | 2-8d (24" x 0.113")

22§ . 3 e
face nail 3 staples 17/ 4

23 Wider than 1" x 8" sheathing to each | 3-8d (2'/," % 0.113") L
bearing, face nail 4 staples 17/4"

Floor
24 |Joist to sill or girder, toe nail

25

Rim joist to top plate, toe nail (roof
applications also)

26

Rim joist or blocking to sill plate, toe
nail

27

28

1" x 6" subfloor or less to each joist,
2" subfloor to joist or girdergl

29

face nail
and face nail ool

2" planks (plank & beam - floor &,
roof)

at each bearing

30

Built-up gir
lumber layers

. Lé

Nail each layer as follows:
32" o.c. at top and bottom
and staggered.

Two nails at ends and at
each splice.

At each joist or rafter




TABLE 91.5.602.3(1)—continued FASTENER SCHEDULE FOR STRUCTURAL

MEMBERS
SPACING OF FASTENERS
DESCRIPTION OF DESCRIPTION OF : —
ITEM BUILDING PASTENER™© ¢ Edges | Intermediate supports”
MATERIALS (inches) (inches)

Wood structural panels, subfloor, roof and interior wall sheathing to framing and
particleboard wall sheathing to framing

32

3/8“ _ 1/2n

6d common (2" X
0.113") nail (subfloor
wall)

8d common (2f/2" P
0.131") nail (roof)

128

33

19/3211 - 1“

8d common nail (27 0
0.131")

34

11/8" - 11/4|1

10d common
0.148"ynail or &
8d 2} ﬁx0131")

35

- Tiron %
anail, /14" Gio!
‘”‘*‘ii 16

1" gal%ed o0

36

37

A % m sheathm

g %ji"

" \{amzed rooﬁng
Inail; staple.galvanized,
long® P/, screws,
’I;w e Wor S

" galvanized roofing

h k_,,.%%ﬂ staple galvanized,
" |Type Wor S

5/ " long; 1°/5" screws,

Wood structural panels, combination subfloor underlayment to framing

39

3/4" and less

6d deformed (2" x
(.120") nail or

8d common (2i/2” X
0.131") nail

12

40

: 7/8” - ln

8d common (2'/" x
0.131") nail or

12




&d deformed (21/2” ®
0.120") nail

10d common (3" x
(0.148") nail or

8d deformed (2'/," x
0.120") nail

41 AR DA

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 mile per hour = 0.447 m/s; 1 Ksi = 6.895 MPa.

a. All nails are smooth-common, box or deformed shanks excegtsﬁwhere otherwise stated. Nails

used for framing and sheathing connections shall have minimimt @verage bending yield strengths
as shown: 80 ksi for shank diameter of 0.192 inch (20d co ofl nall), 90 ksi for shank diameters
larger than 0.142 inch but not larger than 0.177 inch, aé% @%for shank diameters of 0.142

inch or less.
b. Staples are 16 gage wire and have a minim ;
¢. Nails shall be spaced at not more than 6 in f nc
inches or greater.
d. Four-foot by 8-foot or 4- foot by 9- foot panels sha e aggliﬁd)vemcally

fased on Table 91.5. 60 302).

f For regions having basic wind speed o

shall be used for attaching plywood anﬁg&;goo >

minimum 48-1nch distance from gable enﬁ@valls,
T

eathingpanel edges apphes to panel edges supported by
king and at all floor perimeters only. Spacing of fasteners on
o panel edges supported by framing members and required

blocking. Blocking ofi1
need not be provided e
supported by framing me

required by other provisions of this code. Floor perimeter shall be
ers or solid blocking.

j. Where a rafter is fastened to an adjacent parallel ceiling joist in accordance with this schedule,
provide two toe nails on one side of the rafter and toe nails from the ceiling joist to top plate in
accordance with this schedule. The toe nail on the opposite side of the rafter shall not be
required.

k. Use of Staples in braced wall panels shall be prohlblted in Seismic Design Category Dy, Dy, or
D,.



Sec. 9. Table 91.5.602.3(2) of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to
read as follows:

TABLE 91.5.602.3(2) ALTERNATE ATTACHMENTS TO TABLE 91.5.602.3(1)

SPACING® OF FASTENERS
NOMINAL DESCRIPTION*" OF :
MATERIAL FASTENER AND LENGTH |  Edges Intermediate
THICKNESS (inches) (inches) (inches) S('_JPS:)‘::)S
m

Wood structural panels subfloor, roof® and wall sheathi

wall sheathing to feamiel”

Up to Z/2 6
6
%32 and */y
8
23/32 and 3/4 8
6
1
8
SPACING® OF FASTENERS
ML
%[.,A& Edges Body of paneld
(inches) (inches)
Floor unﬂ%ﬁ&ymen’ﬁ%ywood-hardboard-particleboard
Plywood
1, tgmg or screw shank nail-
' minimum 3 6
¥ 5, > ga. (0.099") shank
sand 71 diameter
Stap}e 18 ga., Is, /16 crown 9 5
width
1'/4 ring or screw shank nail-
Hy 3, 15 1 minimum e
32, /s, "/, and 12", ga. (0.099”) shank 6 8
diameter
I . A
19/ 5. B/ and ¥, 1'/>ring or screw shank nail- 6 2
minimum




12'/, ga. (0.099") shank

diameter
Staple 16 ga. 1/, 6 8
Hardboard'
1' long ring-grooved
. ) 6
underlayment nail
0.200 4d cement-coated sinker nail 6 6
Staple 18 ga., /g long {plastic
5.3 6
coated)

Particleboard &

nail

1
/
¢ Staple 18 ga., /s lo !

way.

f. Hardboard underlayment shall conform to CPA/ANSI A135.4

g. Specified alternate attachments for roof sheathing shall be permitted for windspeeds less than
100 mph. Fasteners attaching wood structural panel roof sheathing to gable end wall framing
shall be installed using the spacing listed for panel edges.



Sec. 10. Section 91.5.602.3.2 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows.

91.5.602.3.2. Top Plate. Wood stud walls shalil be capped with a double top plate
installed to provide overlapping at corners and intersections with bearing partitions. End
joints in top plates shall be offset at least 24 inches (610 mm). Joints in plates need not
ocecur over studs. Plates shall be not less than 2 inches (51 mm) nominal thickness and
have a width at least equal to the width of the studs.

EXCEPTION: In other than Seismic Desigl

«Category Do, Dy or D2, a

)%glvamzed steel plate that is

SIX8d nal%%%g%each side, provided the

rafters or jOIStS are centered over the sfilds with a tolerance of no more than 1
omitt ‘thatare adequately tied

" or equrvalent as
e

&
in its ennrety

Sec. 12. Table 91.5.602.10.2
entirety. X

10




Sec. 14. Figure 91.5.602.10.3.2 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended

to read as follows:

PANEL LENGTH PER
THELE 915602405

RN, IBREETNGDD
BTRUIGTURRL BANTL R
SHEATHING D3 OHE FACE

Kitd 2 4 PRARIHG WM, o
BOLUERE 8TU0S RECGLERED

/
=

B WAL FRNEL HESHT

el

123 WOLD D0 DR (27 SYRARTHFE
EMCHORS PER TABLE FBIZLI0.0 D‘:i!ﬂ&'«\\

SRAT

£5F BACH SHOWH FOR CLARITYL
BTRAPTHPE A HCHORE DAL BE
PERMITTED TO DEATTACHED OvER
THE WO ETRUTTIRAL PAjEL ' 3, R

PANEL HUST BEAT TACHED
TQ SOHCRETE FOOTING OR
COMCRETE FLUNBATIOH e
WALL CONTIRAIDUS DVER
BEAGEL WaLL LINE

o
e DRAMETER AMCHOR S
BOLTE LOCATED BETWER
FTARID 12 U ERORERD OF
THE SEQMENT

For 8I: 1inch =254 mm.

FIGURE 91.5.602.106.3.2

FLE PAMEL BPLIGE F MERRED
ARMCHERMG FAHEL ERGED SAALL NEET
UYER &R0 88 FARTENEY T DR o
FRARIME

A DO BT DR GELY BDS MAILS 4
50, &T PANEL EDGES. FUR SMGLE
BTCHY S0 {4 O O PAREL 20@

FOR THE FIRET OF 2 STERIES

ETUDS UWDEE HEADER A REJLIRED

B0 DU QR GALY, B MELE 6437
080 AT IMTERIGR SUPPORTS

iR, REMFORCING OF POUNDATION,
DRE fd BAR TOP &40 BOTTOM. LA
BERE 28" MINIVLIN,

RMINIMUM FOOTING BIZE UNDER
CPENING 18§27 12

METHOB BW — ALTERNATE BRACED WALL PANEL

11



Sec. 15. Table 91.5.602.10.3(3) of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows: '

TABLE 91.5.602.10.3(3)
BRACING REQUIREMENTS BASED ON SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY

) %?ﬁfﬁ%fgﬁ; 10 FEET MINIMUM TOTAL LENGTH (FEET) OF
= BRACED WALL PANELS
» 10 PSF FLOOR DEAD LOAD REQUIRED ALONG EACH BRACED
« 15 PSF ROOF/CEILING DEAD LOAD WALL LINE®
« BRACED WALL LINE SPACING < 25 FEET A
" IMethods
Braced DWB, Methods
Seismic Design g . Wall : thod| SFB, Method] CS-
Category tory Location LLme iz - N }’BS, WSP | WSP,
ength !
(feeu g Cs-G
14
2.7
4.1
54
6.8
2.6
5.1
¢ . 7.7
120 | 102
150 | 128
3.8
. 77
13.5 | 115
180 | 153
225 | 19.1
16
3.1
4.6
6.1
7.7
32
. 6.4
113 | 96
150 | 1238

12




50 NP NP NP 18.8 16.0
10 NP NP NP 5.3 4.5
20 NP NP NP 10.5 9.0
30 NP NP NP 15.8 13.4
40 NP NP NP 21.0 17.9
50 NP NP NP 26.3 22.3

(continued)

SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY

* SOIL CLASS D"

*« WALL HEIGHT = 10 FEET

« 10 PSF FLOOR DEAD LOAD

¢ 15 PSF ROOF/CEILING DEAD LOAD
* BRACED WALL LINE SPACING < %@g\EET

Methods
Seismic Design Method| CS-
Category WSP | WSP,
CS-G
2.0 1.7
4.0 3.4
6.0 5.1
8.0 6.8
10.0 8.5
4.5 3.8
20 NP NP NP 9.0 7.7
Dy 30 NP NP NP 13.5 11.5
40 NP NP NP 18.0 15.3
50 NP NP NP 22.5 19.1
10 NP NP NP 6.0 5.1
e~ 20 NP NP NP 12.0 10.2
‘ 30 NP NP NP 18.0 15.3
40 NP NP NP 24.0 20.4
50 NP NP NP 300 25.5

13




10 NP 8.0 8.0 2.5 2.1
20 NP 16.0 16.0 5.0 4.3
30 NP 24.0 24.0 7.5 6.4
40 NP 32.0 32.0 10.0 8.5
50 NP 40.0 40.0 12.5 10.6

stional Bilh kcéng Code.
..-,' S

Ve, ypsumé%ard fastened to at least one side with nails or screws
-R602.3(1) for exterior sheathing or Table R702.3.5 for interior gypsum

rs at panel edges shall not exceed 8 inches.

board, Sp g of fa
d. Method CS-SE Beagblict in SDC C only.
€. Methods GB an- 2CP braced wall panel h/w ratio shall not exceed 1:1 in SDC Dy, Dy, and D,.
Methods DWB, SFB PBS, and HPS are not permitted in SDC Dy, D4, and D..

14




Sec. 16. Table 91.5.602.10.4 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to

read as follows:

TABLE 91.5.602.10.4
BRACING METHODS '
METHODS, MINIMUM FICURE CONNECTION CRITERIA®
MATERIAL THICKNESS Kasteners Spacing
| x4 q Wood: 2-8d  {Wood: per
wgo orl .. common nails  stud and top
spproved e A5 ot fndvotom
LIB oo . 13-8d (2'/," long x [plates
Let-in-bracing at 45° to 60 LE.0.113" dia.) nails
angles for : .
maximum 16" Metal:
d . per
stud spacing manufacturer
3 e ;
N
Diagonal or Per stud
wood boards 2 - 1°/4" Jong
stud s _
staples
g Exterior
% %%thlng USINg | g edges 12"
< . ommon nails field
o) 1@2.57x 0.1317) per
§ Table R602.3(3)
s Interior sheathing
5 pes )
e | et
01.5.602.3(1) or
91.5.602.3(2)
4" at panel
edges
12"at
See Figure  |8d common (2'/,” |intermediate

R602.10.6.5 % 0.131) nails  [supports 4"at
Veneer (See braced wall
. panel end
Section osts
R602.10.6.5) P
17" long x 0.12"
SFB i 25, n : % "ol
Structural 2 or 5 f?’r e dia. (fmf 2 t? 1?,}{ 3" edges 6"
maximum 16 w+ | sheathing) 17/4
fiberboard stud spacin long = 0.12" di field
sheathing bacibg £ &

(for °/3," thick

15




sheathing)
galvanized
roofing nails or
8d common
(2'/2" long x

0.131" dia.) nails

Nails or screws [For all braced
per Tabie wall
91.5.602.3(1) for |panel
GB diexterior locations [locations: 7"
Gypsum Ly v edges
board Nails or serews ;11 ding top
e perTable o4 ottom
‘ plates) 7"
field
PBS T :
Particleboard e fong 0 % .. )
sheathing dia.) nails 7 3" edges 6
) For "/»", 8d field
(See Section
comumon
5(21," long x
131" dia.) nails
o 1/2” *f,-"ng’ 11 6"0.c. on all
-~ gage, /16" dia. fran‘li.n
head nails memb egr s
0.092" dia.,
0.225" dia. head
nails with length | _, "
to accommodate 4 ef(‘iglzs 8
1 ;/2" 1e
penetration into
studs
Wk . See
Alternate %7 15/32" IS{Z?)ZS ?%tigri Section
braced wall o R602.10.6.1

(continued)

16




TABLE 91.5.602.10.4—continued

Intermittent| hold-downs

with

R602.10.6.2

BRACING METHODS '
CONNECTION
METHODS, MINIMUM gRITPiERi A?
MATERIAL THICKNESS -
Fasteners Spacing
PFH

Portal frame 15/30" See Section | See Section
R602.10.6.2

Bracing
Methods

Portal frame

PFG

15/32"

BR602.10.6.3

See Section

See Section
R602.10,6.3

at garage
6" edges 12"
CS-WSP field
Continuously| *
sheathed Interior
wood [ sheathing per
k. Table Varies by
91.5.602.3(1)| fastener
or
91.5.602.3(2)
See Method | See Method
CS-WSP CS-WSsp

Contintiously

See Section

See Section

sheathed 15/32 R602.10.6.4 | R602.10.6.4
portal frame
i
d 1 /2" 10ﬂg ®
COSSEB |t or By 0.12" dia.
OMHNUOUSLY for (for ', thick | 3" edges 6"
sheathed . " , .
maximum 16 sheathing) field
structural . 3
stud spacing 17/4" long x
fiberboard s
0.12" dia.

17



(fOr 25/32;;
thick
sheathing)
galvanized
roofing nails
or
8d common
(2'/5" long x
0.131" dia.)

i, nails

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 305 mm, | degi
foot = 47.8 N/m?, 1 mile per hour = 0.447 m/s

a. Adheszve attachment of Wali sheathmg ifichad g Me

i _

thod GB,

s "su'

Categories D'i 7K
. Methods GB a %‘
)

18




Sec. 17. Figure 91.5.602.10.3.3 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in
its entirety. :

Sec. 18. Figure 91.5.602.10.6.2 of the L.os Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

SHTENY OF BE 200 WITH S41I0E PORTAL FRANES (W0 BRAGED VWAL PANE 15 et ey

e, B Y FUSHE L WY T OF OFERING y,
FOR SIRGLE 0% DOVELE FORYAL -
TTTETT R : TERSIGN ST PER =
oo 3 TIBLE K302 102 4Dl
RERET HOGh I O v e
ol 2BE ATHING) S S
— it <]
; i
: ; e s S 2 F HESHER, PANEL £\
it - ’ RELTE EDREE SHALL ﬁéi
3 FRERTE N RUELTH NG 70 REAOER WATH 82 GOGLTE OYER AND BE e £RETER TOP
= X 3 COMAON: T SALGHIZED BOX HALE I ¥ CRID HUAHED T0 GORMUN At
& A& PATTERK A5 FHOWH BLOLKING WITHIN HE AR T
g 4 Y WIDELE 2 UF WALl R DR BT
& W e BEAUER THJAUCGTUR BTRAP PLA TADIE U BEIGHT, OwE THO )
% by REDLIGE 2 O BOTH SMES. OF GOENING ROWOE TR, RO OF 16U
2 T CPPOGITE Si0E OF SHEATHIG (ALK S REAURED ;jigfg Fﬂi;1v ¥
1 [ b ) HEALH RANELEDGE, o
I oo B, L
¥ Wl EEL e RN, DOUBLE 2X4 FRAVING COYERED WITH NI, e i $51° DL
g 008 oo 5327 THICK WDOD STRUCTURAL PANEI, SHEATHING TYPIDAL DOTTAL by RN, 15/427 WOGH
3 - e 3«\1§ VETE B¢ COMMON OR SALVANIZED BOX NS AT 2 FRAME CORSTRUGTIDN b\e&(:ciﬂgif\t Pk
T T ] 0.0, N ALL FRAMENG [STUDS, BUDCKMNG, AMD SLLSFTYR: SHEATHING
Neee WL LEMBTH OF FARTL PER TANE REERAGY

e HIN. @PTOT LB BERAPIYRE HOLED DOINS
EIMBEDOIN TR CONCRETE AHD HALED 1D
FRLA G

B REISICREING OF COUNBATION, ONE R4 a8
TP AND BOTTGH OF FOGTING. LAR BARS 24"
;{ nAltElAA LS,

el sy 27 o

T

N e BSIRBAUNY FOOMING SIZE ONDER OPENINGS 5
\\ Er gty
e W13, (S UIATIE TR A THER BOLT INETALLED PER
BATET B - 3 THR % 35 X S6 PLATE WaSHER
FRONT ELEVATICGN SECTHON

Sec. 19. Section 91.5.602.10.3.3 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted
in its entirety.

19



Sec. 20. Table 91.5.602.10.4.1 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in

its entirety.

Sec. 21. Figure 91.5.602,10.4.1.1 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code Is deleted

in its entirety.

Sec. 22. Table 91.5.602.10.5 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to

read as follows:

CONTRIBUTING

METHOD
(See Table R602.10.4) LENGTH
(inches)
DWB, WSP, SFB, PBS, [ Actual
PCP, HPS, BV-WSP
Double sided =
Actual
Single sided = 0.5 x
Actual
Actual®
48
48
PFH ,
Ssltlfgfan%ﬁoof 24 24 124 |27 29° 48
PFG 24 27 30 {33 36° 1.5 x Actual’
CS-G 24 27 30 | 33 | 36 Actual®
CS-PR 24 24 24 | 24° | 24° Actual®
Adjacent clear
CS-WSP, | opening height
CS-SFB (inches)
<64 24 27 30 | 33 1 36 Actual®

20




but wall height may:be-increased to 12 feet with pony wall.

Sec. 23. Figure 91.5.602.10.6.4 of the LLos Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

21



(e EFI A SEADER 1170 BRI ROEAFIANRS | 5O SRACH kL, BAIELE

EXTENT OF HEATER Wil JH% PORTAL FRAME
etz PRRED
g Xt FIL SR raxwwcamm
r.,mm.. JROPR——
o SRR ORIV ORI, T T—.
N R TALE B IR S
P FREOOPORTL A0
} fd] Q;ﬂ‘ I A T
i f L R w L
! H £ GO R SHEATIR
J ? et ?;‘;n#sréma HRaTans #
; ! LTS SHENTIRG T SRS A 0D H e : [
é % ] SRR D P S PSR B DS : i e ?ag?gﬁ iﬁs%‘glg
E ol om FATTRAN RS R Rt [ — HE RONEOF VI S0
FIE B ; AR S g i HALZATIGE TR
b o e HERSES T FATESTUD GTRAR IEH TARE s B 1 Bl A Bt E3 ¥
COE A RO £.4 T B0 T S O SRR FH g o I
2 & ¢-§ bt LEPOHIEEDEOE QLA HIG : i ﬂ,}w\m BuCrmnts O |
& 5 & i i o PR 25 B ¥ SR 1
O T ' ' i ; S I
O i MM, BOUBLE 2K FRAMING DOVERED WITH BN, 11 S, 38 .
% g % oo 52427 THISK WOk STAUCTURAL BANEL ; Betiais B ﬁéﬁﬁ%ﬁfﬂﬁq
E 5o SHEATHING WITH 80 SOMMON OR gasvmizen  1H M?giﬁ,‘ i k: ; MEATANE
3 3 o 33 HON HRILE AT 3V 0.0, Iy ALL FRANING (3TRDE, : -i; 4+
;o o BLAGRING, AND SIS TYE i ' W
] N ne s B
1 . LTy e
; '§< Ft e M, LENGTH OF RANEL RER TABLE 216 602.10.5 AN ST . :\ ; %
VI
i j he B ; ] )
4 3 e 5. £ 4 SARTH AN MRS H FE - 4 i
{ n 5 i ww;.m& HER RIS | AR DY 2L E i H ﬁ;ﬁgﬁﬁwﬁi i a
i [ W iy 3 Wl L5 )
i i e & 1y ; wwmcwew~ %
X . : ; TAREGS
B R mz i& X% 1
&

b

”.‘\»
M AL BOLTE $N
OVER CORURETE {4 FASCIREY SROLKR FOUNDATYN i

Far8I: 1 inch =254 mm, 1 fcot 304 8 mm.

number of screws in th e ”n ect;on is permitted to be reduced in accordance with the
reduction factors in Table“§603.2.4, when larger screws are used or when one of the

sheets of steel being connected is thicker than 33 mils (0.84 mm). When applying the
reduction factor, the resulting number of screws shall be rounded up.

Sec. 25. Table 91.5.802.5.1(9) of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended
to read as follows:

22




TABLE 91.5.802.5.1(9) RAFTER/CEILING JOIST HEEL JOINT
CONNECTIONSa’ b’ €, da €, f, h

GROUND SNOW LOAD (psf)
208 30 50 70
RAFTER é},ﬁ%ﬁﬁ% o = x Roof span (feet) . R
SLOPE | ches) | 12|20 [28(36{12 |20 |28 36 |12/20 |28 |36 12|20 2836
Required number of 16d com%}?,? nails®° per heel joint
12 41618 8 11211516 11115120
3:12 16 518110 11(15120] 8 11412026
24 7 11115 16(23130]12:2113039
12 3 6 11 8 |12]15
4:12 16 4 11115720
24 5 1623129
12 3 719112
5:12 16 3 9112]16
24 4 131823
3 719
3 9|11

13|17

517

AT

Sy B W~ W RPN Y R
O

oo W B
~1

b. Nailing requir¢i shall be permitted to be reduced 25 percent if nails are clinched.
c. Heel joint connections are not required when the ridge is supporied by a load-bearing
wall, header or ridge beam.

d. When intermediate support of the rafter is provided by vertical struts or purlins to a
load-bearing wall, the tabulated heel joint connection requirements shall be permitted to
be reduced proportionally to the reduction in span.

e. Equivalent nailing patterns are required for ceiling joist fo ceiling joist lap splices.

f. When rafter ties are substituted for ceiling joists, the heel joint connection requirement
shall be taken as the tabulated heel joint connection requirement for two-thirds of the
actual rafter slope.

23



g. Applies to roof live load of 20 psf or less.

h. Tabulated heel joint connection requirements assume that ceiling joists or rafter ties are
located at the bottom of the attic space. When ceiling joists or rafter ties are located
higher in the attic, heel joint connection requirements shall be increased by the following
factors:

He/Hy Heel Joint Corg;ecctt)i:n Adjustment
173 K
1/4 |
1/5
1/6
1/10 or less

where: :
Hc = Height of ceiling joists or rafter ties medsuee
support walls. %

Hp = Height of roof ridge meas; : i

i. Edge Distances,.en

ils shamv?%%%fé;
the wood. .

2.
T
By

Sec. 26. The City Clerk shall certify to the passage of this ordinance and have it

published in accordance with Council policy, either in a daily newspaper circulated
in the City of Los Angeles or by posting for ten days in three public places in the City of
Los Angeles: one copy on the bulletin board located at the Main Street entrance to the

24




Los Angeles City Hall; one copy on the hulletin board located at the Main Street
entrance to the L.os Angeles City Hall East; and one copy on the bulletin board located
at the Tempie Street entrance to the Los Angeles County Hall of Records.

| hereby certify that this ordinance Was passed by the Councu of the Clty of
Los Angeles, at its meeting of _

JUNE LAGMAY, City Clerk

Deputy

Approved

Approved as to Form and Legali

M:\Real Prop Env Land Use\Land Use\Kim Westhof\DBS--2013 Code
Amendmeni\2014 Residential Master Ordinance KRW Draft.docx

25



