
ORDINANCE NO. _

An ordinance amending Article 3, Chapter IX of the Los Angeles Municipal Code
to reflect local administrative changes and incorporate by reference portions of the 2013
Edition of the California Residential Code (C.R.C.).

THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY OF LOS ANGELES
DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 91.5.101 of the Los Angeles
read as follows:

icipal Code is amended to

SEC. 91.5.101. TITLE.

e shall collectively be
ions of the LAR.C.

tion, movement,

s Angeles Residential Code adopt by
(C. B.C.) or the California Residential

nits complying with the requirements of Section 419 of
the Califor de shall be permitted to be built as one- and two-family
dwellings or . Fire suppression required by Section 419.5 of the
California Build e when constructed under the California Residential Code
for one- and two-fa ily dwellings shall conform to Section 903.3.1.3 of the
California Building Code.

2. Owner-occupied lodging houses with five or fewer guestrooms shall
be permitted to be built in accordance with the California Residential Code for
one- and two-family dwellings when equipped with a fire sprinkler system in
accordance with Section R313.

1



Sec. 2. Section 91.5.301.1.4 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to
read as follows:

91.5.301.1.4. Seismic Design Provisions For Buildings Constructed On Or Into
Slopes Steeper Than One Unit Vertical In Three Units Horizontal (33.3 Percent
Slope). The design and construction of new buildings and additions to existing
buildings when constructed on or into slopes steeper than one unit vertical in three units
horizontal (33.3 percent slope) shall comply with Section 91.1613.8 of the Los Angeles
Municipal Code.

Sec. 3. Section 91.5.301.2.2.3.5.1 of the Los
in its entirety.

Municipal Code is deleted

Sec. 4. Section 91.5.301.2.2.3.8 of the
read as follows:

unicipal Code is added to

Components
uipment shall

t shall be

) or less and has a center of
ing structure; or

(89N) or less or, in the case of a

red paragraph of Section 91.5.401.1 of the Los
read as follows:

91.5.401.1. A
construction of ttl
provisions of this C
areas as established
Wood foundations shall

rovisions of this chapter shall control the design and
d foundation spaces for all buildings. In addition to the

esign and construction of foundations in flood hazard
91.5.301.2(1) shall meet the provisions of Section R322.

designed and installed in accordance with AF&PA PWF.

Sec. 6. Section 91.5.501.1 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to
read as follows:

91.5.501.1. Application. The provisions of this Division shall control the design and
construction of the floors for all buildings including the floors of attic spaces used to
house mechanical or plumbing fixtures and equipment. Mechanical or plumbing fixtures

2



and equipment shall be attached (or anchored) to the structure in accordance with
Section 91.5.301.2.2.3.8.

Sec. 7. Section 91.5.600 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to read
as follows:

SEC. 91.5.600. BASIC PROVISIONS.

Chapter 6 of the C.R.C. is hereby adopted by reference with the EXCEPTIONs,
modifications and additions set forth below. Additionally, 02.10.9.1 from the 2013
California Building Code is not adopted.

Sec. 8. Table 91.5.602.3(1) of the Los An
read as follows:

. ipal Code is amended to

3



TABLE 91.5.602.3(1) FASTENER SCHEDULE FOR STRUCTURAL MEMBERS

DESCRIPTION OF BUILDING NUMBER AND SPACING OFITEM TYPE OFELEMENTS FASTENERa, b, e FASTENERS

Roof

1 Blocking between joists or rafters to 3-8d (21/2" x 0.113")top plate, toe nail
2 Ceiling joists to plate, toe nail 3-8d (21/2" x 0.1

3 Ceiling joists not attached to parallel
rafter, laps over partitions, face nail

4 Collar tie to rafter, face nail or 11/4" x
20 gage ridge strap

nails on one side and
5 Rafter or roof truss to plate, toe nail iIon opposite side

er or truss!

6 Roof rafters to ridge, valley
rafters: toe nail face nail

7 Built-up studs- fac 24" O.c.

8 Abutting stud 12" o.c.corners, fac

9 Built-up hea 16" o.c. along each edgespacer
10 2" x 0.135") 16" o.c. along each edge
11 12" x 0.113")
12 10d (3" x 0.128") 24" O.c.
13 Do 10d (3" x 0.128") 24" o.c.

Double
14 offset ofe 8-16d (31/z" x 0.135")

lapped area

15 Sole plate to joi 16d (31/2" x 0.135") 16" o.c.nail

16 Sole plate to joist or blocking at 3-16d (31/2" x 0.135") 16" o.c.braced wall panels
3-8d (21/z" x 0.113")

17 Stud to sole plate, toe nail or 2-16d (31/2" x
0.135")

18 Top or sole plate to stud, end nail 2-16d (31/2" x 0.135")

19 Top plates, laps at corners and 2-10d (3" x 0.128")intersections, face nail

4



20 1" brace to each stud and plate, face 2-8d (21/2" x 0.113")
nail 2 staples 1 31/ x

21 1" x 6" sheathing to each bearing, 2-8d (21/z" x 0.113")
face nail 2 staples I 3/4"

22 1" x 8" sheathing to each bearing, 2-8d (21/z" x 0.113")
face nail 3 staples 1 3/4

23 Wider than 1" x 8" sheathing to each 3-8d (21/2" x 0.113")
bearing, face nail 4 staples e14"

Floor
24 Joist to sill or girder, toe nail 3-8d (21/2"

25 Rim joist to top plate, toe nail (roof 8d (21
applications also)

26 Rim joist or blocking to sill plate, toe
nail

27 1" x 6" subfloor or less to each joist,
face nail

28 2" subfloor to joist or girder
and face nail

29 2" planks (plank & beam - floo
roof)

6" O.c.

6" o.c.

at each bearing

ail each layer as follows:
32" o.c. at top and bottom
and staggered.
Two nails at ends and at
each splice.

30

31 At each joist or rafter

5



TABLE 91.5.602.3(1)-continued FASTENER SCHEDULE FOR STRUCTURAL
MEMBERS

ITEM
DESCRIPTION OF SPACING OF FASTENERS

DESCRIPTION OF
BUILDING FASTENERb, c, e Edges Intermediate supports" e

MATERIALS (inches)' (inches)
Wood structural panels, subfloor, roof and interior wall sheathing to framing and

particleboard wall sheathing to framing

32

33

31" II"8 - 2

191" 1"32 -

6d common (2" x
0.113") nail (subfloor
wall)'
8d common (21/z" x
0.131 ") nail (roof)"
8d common nail
0.131")
10d common
0.148") nail or
8d ( 1 "x 0.131")
def '1~ __-L -L__ ~ __

34

35
1/2" structura

cellulosi
fiberboard

36

37

38

39

40

nized roofing
ail; st alvanized,

"long, 14 screws,
eWorS
" galvanized roofing
I;staple galvanized,

%" long; 15/8" screws,
Type WorS

6

3

7

6

7 7

7

Wood structural panels, combination subfloor underlayment to framing
6d deformed (2" x
0.120") nail or
8d common (21/z" x
0.131 ") nail
8d common (2 liz " x
0.131")nailor

6

6

12

12

6



8d deformed (2Ih" x
0.120") nail
1Odcommon (3" x

41 Ills" _ 11/4" 0.H8") nail or 6 128d deformed (21/2" x
0.120") nail

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 mile per hour = 0.447 m/s; 1 Ksi = 6.895 MPa.
a. All nails are smooth-common, box or deformed shanks exce where otherwise stated. Nails
used for framing and sheathing connections shall have mini verage bending yield strengths
as shown: 80 ksi for shank diameter of 0.192 inch (20d ail), 90 ksi for shank diameters
larger than 0.142 inch but not larger than 0.177 inch, . for shank diameters of 0.142
inch or less.
b. Staples are 16 gage wire and have a minim
c. Nails shall be spaced at not more than 6 in
inches or greater.
d. Four-foot by 8-foot or 4-foot by 9-foot panels s
e. Spacing of fasteners not included table shall
f. For regions having basic wind spe h or gre
shall be used for attaching plywood an ural pan
minimum 48-inch distance om gable e roof
35 feet maximum.
g. For regions havin or attaching wood structural
panel roof sheathing e spaced inches on center. When basic
wind speed is greater th g panel roof sheathing to intermediate
supports ed 6 I 48-inch distance from ridges, eaves and
gable e ches 11framing.
h. Gy nfor STM . 6 and shall be installed in accordance with
OA 253. hall nn to ASTM C 208.
i. Spacing 0 athin el edges applies to panel edges supported by
framing mem king and at all floor perimeters only. Spacing of fasteners on
roof sheathing pa 0 panel edges supported by framing members and required
blocking. Blocking o sheathing panel edges perpendicular to the framing members
need not be provided e quired by other provisions of this code. Floor perimeter shall be
supported by framing me or solid blocking.
j. Where a rafter is fastened to an adjacent parallel ceiling joist in accordance with this schedule,
provide two toe nails on one side of the rafter and toe nails from the ceiling joist to top plate in
accordance with this schedule. The toe nail on the opposite side of the rafter shall not be
required.
k. Use of Staples in braced wall panels shall be prohibited in Seismic Design Category Do,DI, or
D2.

own width.
here spans are 48

7



Sec, 9, Table 91,5,602,3(2) of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to
read as follows:

TABLE 91.5.602.3(2) ALTERNATE ATTACHMENTS TO'TABLE 91.5.602.3(1)

DESCRIPTION" b OF
FASTENER AND LENGTH

(inches)

NOMINAL
MATERIAL

THICKNESS (inches)

Wood structural panels subfloor, roof! and wall sheathi
wall sheathing to fra

0,097 - 0,099 Nai12I(

SPACINGC OF FASTENERS

Edges
(inches)

Intermediate
supports
(inches)

framing and particleboard

6

6

8

8

6

4 8
SP ACINGc OF FASTENERS

Edges
(inches)

Body of panel"
(inches)

Plywood
ood-hardboard-particleboard"

or screw shank nail-
minimum

ga, (0,099") shank
diameter

3 6

Staple 18 ga, 7/8, /16 crown
width

11/ 3/ 15/ d 1/32, 8, 32, an 2

11/4 ring or screw shank nail-
minimum

12Ih ga, (0,099") shank
diameter

2

6

5

8e

11/2 ring or screw shank nail-
minimum

19/ 5/ 23/ d 3/32, 8, 32 an 4

8

6 8



6 8

121/2gao (0.099") shank
diameter

Staple 16 gao li/z
Hardboard!

li/z long ring-grooved
underlayment nail 6 6

0.200 64d cement-coated sinker nail 6
Staple 18 ga., 7/8 long (plastic

coated)
Particleboard

4d ring-grooved underlayme
nail

Staple 18 ga., 7/810

crown

6

6

6

10

6

10

6

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 m
a. Nail is cript
b. Sta
staple
Categor
C. Nails or s
are 48 inches 0

intermediate supp
d. Fasteners shall be p
e. For 5-ply panels, inter
way.
f. Hardboard underlayment shall conform to CPA/ANSI A135.4
g. Specified alternate attachments for roof sheathing shall be permitted for windspeeds less than
100 mph. Fasteners attaching wood structural panel roof sheathing to gable end wall framing
shall be installed using the spacing listed for panel edges.

dified round head or round head.
ch on diameter except as noted. Use of

Is shall be prohibited in Seismic Design

at not ethan 6 inches on center at all supports where spans
aples shall be spaced at not more than 12 inches on center at

pattern throughout the body of the panel.
nails shall be spaced not more than 12 inches on center each

9



Sec. 10. Section 91.5.602.3.2 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows.

91.5.602.3.2. Top Plate. Wood stud walls shall be capped with a double top plate
installed to provide overlapping at corners and intersections with bearing partitions. End
joints in top plates shall be offset at least 24 inches (610 mm). Joints in plates need not
occur over studs. Plates shall be not less than 2 inches (51 mm) nominal thickness and
have a width at least equal to the width of the studs.

Sec. 11. Table 91.5.602.
in its entirety.

EXCEPTION: In other than Seismic Desig
single top plate may be installed in stud walls,
tied at joints, corners and interesting walls b
0.036 inch thick (76 mm by 152 mm by O.
nailed to each wall or segment of wall b
rafters or joists are centered over th
inch (25 mm). The top plate may b
to adjacent wall sections with stee

ategory Do, 01 or O2, a
d the plate is adequately
um 3 inch by 6 inch by
Ivanized steel plate that is

each side, provided the
e of no more than 1

re adequately tied
[ously described.

de is deleted

Sec. 12.
entirety.

10

Sec. 13. S
read as follows:

91.5.602.
length
any I
wall lin
panels.
Category Do,

all Panels. Braced wall lines with a
inimum of two braced wall panels of

I equa inches (1219 mm) or more. Braced
m) sha I have a minimum of two braced wall

ss than 48 inches in length in Seismic Design



Sec. 14. Figure 91.5.602.10.3.2 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended
to read as follows:

jQ}HQLO.DDi\".>N OR (1) ~R:.:P.:T)'F'b _~,~
ANCfl:)RS PERTASLER311210.8J 10140\"
OFEAOHSHOWNFOR CLARITY). \1 "
STW~r~T'1p[;At';;::;~H0R'8G1-IAU_91Z
rERJ'AITTED 1'0 BE ATTACHED OVER \
THE WOC\') 8TRVCT\JRr~l f\il.,NPl \

PANGL MUST9EAT'TACHED
TO COHmETE FOOTING OR
CON(.'RETE fC0N\)AT!ON
W'ALL COl'iT'IHUOUS OVER
BRP,CED WAlL UNE

MIN. 2 X 4. rRAWHC, !.(I~l.
DOOOt.t:: sruns REQUIRED

P,",NEL tEt-l;GTH FER
TABLE 91.$,6&:2_1'0.5

MUi 1SEm""WDOQ
i: STRt!\D~URAt PJ..;.1.,jEL
~:I SHEATHilNG ON CiNE. fACE
I!!

.-'-----.~-

12/112""O1AfitE:'TERANC~
B))t.T2 WQI;:rEl) BETWiSEN
e- AfI,u)17 tW EACHEf\f) Of
THG:SEOJ.ltNf

\
\"

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mID.

rCRf'.{!.f,J2L Bf'UCf.:OF hEFDGJ:1
ADJOINING P;~Nl::Lt1JGES eMRL MEH
OVERtl:ND Sf fA31'EN::DTQ tnlMllOI"J
FRAMING

gO CO'k'lMONDH. GAb!. BOX'NAIU$@(\"
O.C, AT PANE.L EDGES:. FOR SiliGLE
STI)Ft'( ,M'jD@4"QC, F'ANEL'::DGES
FOR Tl~.: FIRST OF 2 S;f(}RIFS

so CCik'lMOhllJRG,;1.,ur 00,; l\\4.1L:'3© 12'
O,(~,i',T It·nSRlm~ S.l.JPPCiR!2

MJN. REI'MFORClNG OF fO'UNDAliON"
ONE ,#4f1AR TOP AiN'D BOTTOM. L}.P
SI'JtS, 2t'" MmlMUM .

M~NIMUM f'ocm-NG size UNDER,
OPEN1NG rs 1l1~X12~.

FIGURE 91.5.602.10.3.2
BW - ALTERNATE BRACED WALL PANEL

11



Sec. 15. Table 91.5.602.10.3(3) of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

TABLE 91.5.602.10.3(3)
BRACING REQUIREMENTS BASED ON SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY

• SOIL CLASS Db
MINIMUM TOTAL LENGTH (FEET) OF• WALL HEIGHT = 10 FEET

• 10 PSF FLOOR DEAD LOAD BRACED WALL PANELS

·15 PSF ROOF/CEILING DEAD LOAD REQUIRED ALONG EACH BRACED

• BRACED WALL LINE SPACING s25 FEET WALL LINE'

Methods
Braced DWB, Methods

Seismic Design Wall SFB, Method CS-
Category Story Location Line PBS, WSP WSP,Lengt P,

(fe CS-G

CS-
2.5 .6 1.4
5.0 .2 2.7
7.5 4.8 4.1
10.0 6.4 5.4
12.5 8.0 6.8
4.5 3.0 2.6
9.0 6.0 5.1

13.5 13.5 9.0 7.7
18.0 18.0 12.0 10.2
22.5 22.5 15.0 12.8

10 NP 6.0 6.0 4.5 3.8
0 NP 12.0 12.0 9.0 7.7
0 NP 18.0 18.0 13.5 11.5

40 NP 24.0 24.0 18.0 15.3
50 NP 30.0 30.0 22.5 19.1
10 NP 5.6 5.6 1.8 1.6
20 NP 11.0 11.0 3.6 3.1
30 NP 16.6 16.6 5.4 4.6
40 NP 22.0 22.0 7.2 6.1

Do 50 NP 27.6 27.6 9.0 7.7
10 NP NP NP 3.8 3.2
20 NP NP NP 7.5 6.4
30 NP NP NP 11.3 9.6
40 NP NP NP 15.0 12.8

12



(continued)

50 NP NP NP 18.8 16.0
10 NP NP NP 5.3 4.5
20 NP NP NP 10.5 9.0
30 NP NP NP 15.8 13.4
40 NP NP NP 21.0 17.9
50 NP NP NP 26.3 22.3

TABLE 91.5.602.10.3(3)-continued BRACI
SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY

• SOIL CLASS Db
• WALL HEIGHT = 10 FEET
• 10 PSF FLOOR DEAD LOAD
• 15 PSF ROOF/CEILING DEAD LOAD
• BRACED WALL LINE SPACING :::

Seismic Design
Category

ENGTH (FEET) OF
PANELS

CHBRACED

Methods
DWB,
SFB, Methods
PBS, Method CS-
PCP, WSP WSP,
HPS, CS-G
CS-

SFBd

6.0 6.0 2.0 1.7
NP 12.0 12.0 4.0 3.4
NP 18.0 18.0 6.0 5.1
NP 24.0 24.0 8.0 6.8

50 NP 30.0 30.0 10.0 8.5
10 NP NP NP 4.5 3.8
20 NP NP NP 9.0 7.7
30 NP NP NP 13.5 11.5
40 NP NP NP 18.0 15.3
50 NP NP NP 22.5 19.1
10 NP NP NP 6.0 5.1
20 NP NP NP 12.0 10.2
30 NP NP NP 18.0 15.3
40 NP NP NP 24.0 20.4
50 NP NP NP 30.0 25.5

13



Cripple wall belo
one- or two-story

dwelling

NP
NP
NP
NP
NP

NP
NP

8.0
16.0
24.0
32.0
40.0
NP
NP
NP
NP
NP
NP
NP

2.5
5.0
7.5
10.0
12.5
5.5
11.0
16.5
22.0
27.5
NP
NP
NP
NP
NP

2.1
4.3
6.4
8.5
10.6
4.7
9.4
14.0
18.7
23.4
NP
NP
NP
NP
NP
6.4
12.8
19.1
25.5
31.9

8.0
16.0
24.0
32.0
40.0

NP
NP
NP
NP
NP
N

.5
15.0
22.5
30.0
37.5

, 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa.

lass "D."A. Interpolation of bracing
associ ith the Seismic Design Categories shall be
Sdsvalue is determined in accordance with Section

ing Code.
c. Met ypsum ard fastened to at least one side with nails or screws

per a xterior sheathing or Table R702.3.5 for interior gypsum
board. S rs at panel edges shall not exceed 8 inches.

d. Method CS- " in SDC Conly.
e. Methods GB an braced wall panel h/w ratio shall not exceed 1:1 in SDC Do, D

"
and D2.

Methods DWB, SFB, PBS, and HPS are not permitted in SDC Do, D" and D2.

14



Sec. 16. Table 91.5.602.10.4 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

TABLE 91.5.602.10.4
BRACING METHODS f

METHODS,
MATERIAL

MINIMUM CONNECTION CRITERIA"
THICKNESS FIGURE Fasteners Spacing

Wood: 2-8d Wood: per
common nails stud and top

or and bottom
8d (21/2" long x plates

0.113" dia.) nails

1 x 4 wood or
approved metal

straps
at 45° to 60°

angles for
maximum 16"
stud spacing

LIB
Let-in-bracing

Metal:
per

manufacturer

3/4"(1" nominal)
for maximumDWB

Diagonal
wood boards

Per studor
2 - 13/4" long

staples
Exterior

hing using
mmon nails

.5"x 0.131") per
Table R602.3(3)

6" edges 12"
field

Interior sheathing
per

Table
91.5.602.3(1) or

91.5.602.3(2)

Varies by
fastener

4" at panel
edges
12"at

8d common (21/2" intermediate
x 0.131) nails supports 4 "at

braced wall
panel end
posts

Panel
Stone

or Masonry
Veneer (See

Section
R602.10.6.5)

See Figure
R602.10.6.5

3" edges 6"
field

11
/2" Ion x 0.l2"

dia. (for ?/z" thick
sheathing) 13/4"
long x 0.12" dia.
(for 25/32" thick

SFB
Structural
fiberboard
sheathing

1/2" or 25/32" for
maximum 16"
stud spacing

15



sheathing)
galvanized

roofing nails or
8dcommon
(21h" long x

0.131" dia.) nails
Nails or screws For all braced

per Table wall
91.5.602.3(1) for panel

terior locations locations: 7"
edges

ails or screws (including top
per Table and bottom

02.3.5 f?r plates) 7"
locations field

GB
Gypsum

board

PBS
Particleboard

sheathing
(See Section

R605)

3" edges 6"
field

6"0.c. on all
framing
members

0.092" dia.,
0.225" dia. head
nails with length
to acconunodate

11/2"

penetration into
studs

4" edges 8"
field

AB
Alternate

braced wall

See
Section

R602.10.6.1

See Section
R602.1 0.6.1

(continued)

16



TABLE 91.S.602.10A-continued
BRACING METHODS f

See Section
R602.10.6.2

METHODS,
MATERIAL FIGURE

CONNECTION
CRITERIA'

Fasteners Spacing

MINIMUM
THICKNESS

PFH
Portal frame

with
hold-downs

15/32"

Intermittent
Bracing I----~-I-----+----
Methods

See Section
R602.10.6.2

Contin sly 15/32" See Section See Section
sheathed R602.10.6.4 R602.10.6.4

portal frame

CS-SFBd 11h" long x
1h" or 25/32" 0.12" dia.Continuously for (for 1/2" thick 3" edges 6"sheathed maximum 16" sheathing) fieldstructural stud spacing 13/4" long x

fiberboard 0.12" dia.

17

PFG
Portal frame

at garage
15/32"

sheath
Table

R602.3(3
CS-WSP

Continuously
sheathed

wood
struc A

Interior
sheathing per

Table
.5.602.3(1)

or
91.5.602.3(2)

See Method
CS-WSP

See Section
R602.10.6.3

r 6" edges 12"
field

Varies by
fastener

See Method
CS-WSP



(for 25h2"

thick
sheathing)
galvanized

roofing nails
or

8dcommon
(iI2" long x
0.131" dia.)

nails

175 rad, I pound per square

Ie end wall or roof
sign Categories

, shall not be permitted in

d ratio shall not exceed 1:I in SDC Do, Dj,
S, and PFG are not permitted in SDC Do,

18



Sec. 17. Figure 91.5.602.10.3.3 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in
its entirety.

Sec. 18. Figure 91.5.602.10.6.2 of the Los Anqeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows: .

'i~ ~,
0 l'
" "~ Pds
~ "

\In.<. iZH<tOIl ie S,l'{N',~tY'Pa HQL!HJOWtiS
[iEl,I6:!!'::nm:pIt{TO COttCR[,~ Aim IIAlLtO urrc
FRJiI.1iItGi'

~

MiN. Rti~lfORtiNG ().fi(:ooNoAtIO~i. oee iN.'!.fAR

I 1dP ANIl BOnm,;! Of' rOOTING. l.I\P BAR$14"
MlNIJ/'UM.

.........L

nf~W OIM,I£TEH,\tH.:tiOR !:IJ!..T!N$TI<l.Lftt PCi'
rADS.1E· ~'<lTl"i2')<J" X 8M;' R.t>.TfWAS.-IER

FRONT ELEVATION

91.5.602.10.6.2
FRAME WITH HOLD-DOWNS AT GARAGE DOOR OPENINGS

I~

.. MIN.. .l.snr v.io<m
Si1'd}Cl'iJRAl p/1',Ni'L
Shb'iTMlNG

',_ r ..SH:Nnw
?LA1'E 70
;{EAtlER i;'mf)

T>'IO
'lIYNl; Of 1W
SllJKr; R ~lA!i.S:t:.T
]" o.c. n:'P

SECTION

Sec. 19. Section 91.5.602.10.3.3 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted
in its entirety.

19



Sec. 20. Table 91.5.602.10.4.1 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in
its entirety.

Sec. 21. Figure 91.5.602.10.4.1.1 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted
in its entirety.

Sec. 22. Table 91.5.602.10.5 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

TABLE 91.5.602.10.5 MINIMUM LENGTH OF

METHOD
(See Table R602.10.4)

DWB, WSP, SFB, PBS,
PCP, HPS, BV-WSP

GB

ED WALL PANELS

Actual"

34 38 42

_-I CONTRIBUTING
LENGTH

(inches)

Double sided =

58 Actual
Single sided = 0.5 x

Actual

32 34 NP NP

24 24 24 24c 24c 48
PFH

24 24 24 27c 29c 48
PFG 24 27 30 33d 36d 1.5 x Actual
CS-G 24 27 30 33 36 Actual"
CS-PF 24 24 24 24c 24e Actual"

Adjacent clear
CS-WSP, opening height
CS-SFB (inches)

:::64 24 27 30 33 36 Actual"

20

48



68 26 27 30 36
72 27 27 30 36
76 30 29 30 36
80 32 30 30 36
84 35 32 32 36
88 38 35 33 36
92 43 37 35 36
96 48 41 38 36
100 44 38
104 49 39
108 5 41
112 43
116 5
120
124
128
132
136
1

pe
th w .t is grea n or equal to the minimum length .

. ht fo is 10 feet in accordance with Figure R602.1 0.6.2, but
ed to et with pony wall.
t for PFG is 10 feet in accordance with Figure R602.10.6.3,
ased to 12 feet with pony wall.

t for CS-PF is 10 feet in accordance with Figure R602.l0.6.4,
creased to 12 feet with pony wall.

c.
wal
d. Maxi
but wall h
e. Maximum
but wall height n

Sec. 23. Figure 91.5.602.10.6.4 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

21



IJI~~, DOl/SlE :lX4 FRAMiNG CQveRI:D \VIm Mm,
~SI3:l'1'l1ICK 'V/DOD STRUCTURAL ~ANEL
SH=,I,.THIN~ wnw ec COMMON -OR GAlWlWZEO
BOX NAILS Ar 3"' C.C;. IoU' AU. FRAMING (stliIDS,
B!l..OCK1NG,AMDS1~S)TYP',

For SL 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 £OO! =304.8 mm.

'~MJN. 1&.<32"WDOO
STfHJCTVRAl ;PA"i':::l
SHEAT#1NG

.10.6.4
PORTAL FRAME CONSTRUCTION

numb d paragraph of Section 91.5.603.2.4 of the Los
ded to read as follows:

Where NO.8 specified in a steel-to-steel connection, the required
number of screws in th ection is permitted to be reduced in accordance with the
reduction factors in Table 603.2.4, when larger screws are used or when one of the
sheets of steel being connected is thicker than 33 mils (0.84 mm). When applying the
reduction factor, the resulting number of screws shall be rounded up.

Sec. 25. Table 91.5.802.5.1 (9) of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended
to read as follows:

22



TABLE 91.5.802.5.1(9) RAFTER/CEILING JOIST HEEL JOINTCONNECTIONS"b, c, d, c, f. h

RAFTERr---------~--------~--------~------~
RAFTERSPACINGr--r__r-~-r~-' __~~~~.-.--.-. __~~~
SLOPE (l h )me es

3:12

70

4:12

12 6 8 12 6 11 15 20
16 8 11 15 8 14 20 26
24 11 16 23 12 21 30 39
12 5 9 5 8 12 15
16 6 2 6 11 15 20
24 8 9 16 23 29
12 4 7 4 7 9 12
16 9 1 5 9 12 16
24 14 18 7 13 18 23
12 5 7 3 5 7 9
1 7 9 4 6 9 11

10 13 5 9 13 17
4 5 3 4 5 7

5 5 7 3 5 7 9
7 8 10 4 7 10 13
3 3 4 3 3 4 5
4 4 5 3 4 5 7
6 6 8 3 6 8 10

5:12

7:12

foot = 304.8 mm, 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa.
mitted to be substituted for 16d common nails.

all be permitted to be reduced 25 percent if nails are clinched.
c. Heel joint connections are not required when the ridge is supported by a load-bearing
wall, header or ridge beam.
d. When intermediate support of the rafter is provided by vertical struts or purlins to a
load-bearing wall, the tabulated heel joint connection requirements shall be permitted to
be reduced proportionally to the reduction in span.
e. Equivalent nailing patterns are required for ceiling joist to ceiling joist lap splices.
f. When rafter ties are substituted for ceiling joists, the heel joint connection requirement
shall be taken as the tabulated heel joint connection requirement for two-thirds of the
actual rafter slope.

23



g. Applies to rooflive load of20 psf or less.
h. Tabulated heel joint connection requirements assume that ceiling joists or rafter ties are
located at the bottom of the attic space. When ceiling joists or rafter ties are located
higher in the attic, heel joint connection requirements shall be increased by the following
factors:

Heel Joint Connection Adjustment
Factor----------~----------~----~1/3

1/4
1/5
1/6

1/10 or less

where:
He = Height of ceiling joists
support walls.
HR = Height of roof ridge mea

of the rafter

i. ufflcient to prevent splitting of

Sec. 26. The City Clerk shall certify to the passage of this ordinance and have it
published in accordance with Council policy, either in a daily newspaper circulated
in the City of Los Angeles or by posting for ten days in three public places in the City of
Los Angeles: one copy on the bulletin board located at the Main Street entrance to the

24



Los Angeles City Hall; one copy on the bulletin board located at the Main Street
entrance to the Los Angeles City Hall East; and one copy on the bulletin board located
at the Temple Street entrance to the Los Angeles County Hall of Records.

I hereby certify that this ordinance was passed by the Council of the City of
Los Angeles, at its meeting of _

JUNE LAGMAY, City Clerk

By __
Deputy

Approved _

Mayor

Approved as to Form and Legali
MICHAEL N. FEUER, City Attorn

M:\Real Prop Env Land Use\Land Use\Kim Westhoff\DBS--2013 Code
Amendment\2014 Residential Master Ordinance KRW Draft.docx

25


