
ORDINANCE NO. _

An ordinance amending Article 9, Chapter IX of the Los Angeles Municipal
Code to reflect local administrative changes and incorporate by reference portions of
the 2013 Edition of the California Green Building Standards Code (CALGreen Code).

THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY OF LOS ANGELES
DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 99.01.101.3.1 of the Los Ange
to read as follows:

Sec. 2.
as follows:

Municipal Code is added

99.01.101.3.1. The provisions of this code shall
that increase the building's conditioned volum
enclosed space provided with mechanical h
Btu/hr-ft'', or is provided with mechanical
Btu/hr-ft".

to residential alterations
ace is defined as an

acity exceeding 10
. exceeding 5

ed to read

Chapter 2 of t
reference except

ids Code is adopted by

ngeles Municipal Code is deleted in

ngeles Municipal Code is deleted in

se Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to

99.02.201.3. Ter
this code and are def
document, such terms s
publications.

Other Documents. Where terms are not defined in
e Los Angeles Building Code or other referenced

have the meanings ascribed to them as in those

Sec. 6. Section 99.02.201.4 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to
read as follows:

99.02.201.4. Terms Not Defined. Where terms are not defined as prescribed in this
section, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted meanings such as context applies.
The definitions in Webster's Third New International Dictionary of the English

1



Language, Unabridged shall be considered as providing ordinarily accepted
meanings.

Section 202 of the CALGreen Code is adopted by reference with the following
amendments:

The following CALGreen Code definitions are not adopted:

CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE

CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL COD

CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CO

CALIFORNIA RESIDENTI

The following definitions ar

DEPARTMENT. T
Los Angeles.

LOS A
Angeles B'
Municipal C

ersion of the Los
of the Los Angeles

ARDS CODE. Articles 1 thru 9 of
de.

LO
Angeles Me
Municipal Cod .

ECHANICAL CODE. The current version of the Los
e, Article 5 of Chapter IX of the Los Angeles

LOS ANGELES PLUMBING CODE. The current version of the Los
Angeles Plumbing Code, Article 4, Chapter IX of the Los Angeles Municipal
Code.

LOS ANGELES RESIDENTIAL CODE. The current version of the Los
Angeles Plumbing Code, Article 1.5, Chapter IX of the Los Angeles Municipal
Code.

The following terms are modified as follows:

2



ELECTRIC VEHICLE (EV). An automotive-type vehicle for on-road
use, such as passenger automobiles, buses, trucks, vans, neighborhood
electric vehicles, and the like, primarily powered by an electric motor that
draws current from a rechargeable storage battery, fuel cell, photovoltaic array,
or other source of electric current. Plug-in hybrid electric vehicles (PHEV) are
considered electric vehicles. For purposes of the Los Angeles Electrical Code,
off-road, self-propelled electric vehicles, such as industrial trucks, hoists, lifts,
transports, golf carts, airline ground support equipment, tractors, boats, and
the like, are not included.

POTABLE WATER. Water that is dri
Environmental Protection Agency (EPA) D .
definition in the Los Angeles Plumbing

nd meets the U. S.
ter Standards. See

Sec. 7. Section 99.03.300 of the L
as follows:

e is added to read

SEC. 99.03.300. BASIC PROVIS ONS.

Chapter 3 of the 2013 Cali
reference except as amended here

Sec. 8. Secti
read as follows:

€ al Code is amended to

d to include the green building
luntary green building measures

in the design and construction of
t are wed unless they are part of Tier 1 or
, .602 is or reference only.

the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to

99.03.301.1.1. Ad Alterations (HCD). The mandatory provisions of
Chapter 4 shall be ap "d', dditions or alterations of existing residential buildings
as specified in Section 9\!J.01.3.

EXCEPTION: On and after January 1, 2014, residential buildings
undergoing permitted alterations, additions or improvements shall replace
noncompliant plumbing fixtures with water-conserving plumbing fixtures.
Plumbing fixture replacement is required prior to issuance of a certificate of
final completion, certificate of occupancy or final permit approval by the local
building Department. See Civil Code Section 1101.1, et seq. for the definition
of a noncompliant plumbing fixture, types of residential buildings affected and
other important enactment dates.

3



Sec. 10. Section 99.03.301.3 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended
to read as follows:

99.03.301.3. Nonresidential Additions and Alterations (BSC). The provisions of
individual sections of Chapter 5 apply to newly constructed buildings, building
additions, and/or building alterations as specified in Section 99.01.101.3. Code
sections relevant to additions and alterations shall only apply to the portions of the
building being added or altered within the scope of the permitted work. A code
section will be designated by a banner to indicate where the code section only applies
to newly constructed buildings [N] or to additions and alte tions [AA]. When the
code section applies to both, no banner will be used.

nicipal Code is deleted inSec. 11. Section 99.03.303.1 of the Los A
its entirety.

Sec. 12. Section 99.03.303.1.1 of
amended to read as follows:

99.03.303.1.1. Tenant Improve
initial tenant or occupant improv
falls under the scope of 99.01.10

pply to the
tion that

. n 99.03.304.1.1 of the

ifficultie volved in complying with
y grant modifications for individual
ial individual reason makes the strict

in conformance with the intent and
on granting modification shall be

ment.

isron Article 9 of Chapter IX of the Los Angeles
ead as follows:

ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 4

IDENTIAL MANDATORY MEASURES

Sec. 15. Section 99.04.100 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

SEC. 99.04.100. BASIC PROVISIONS.

Chapter 4 of the 2013 California Green Building Standards Code is adopted by
reference except as amended herein.

4



Sec. 16. Item 3 of Section 99.04.106.2 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is
deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 17. Section 99.04.106.5 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

99.04.106.5. Cool Roof for Reduction of Heat Island Effect. Roofing material
shall comply with the following:

99.04.106.5.1. Solar Reflectance. Roofing material sh
aged solar reflectance equal to or greater than the val '

ave a minimum 3-year
ecified in Table 4.106.5.

99.04.106.5.2. Thermal Emittance. Roofing m
Rating Council (CRRC) initial or aged thermal
those specified in Table 4.106.5.

II have a Cool Roof
I to or greater than

e value of the
. d aged solar

L

roof area being replaced is equal to
roof area; or

INIMUM 3-YEAR AGED
SOLAR

REFLECTANCE
0.65
0.23

THERMAL
EMITTANCE

0.80
0.80

Sec. 18. Section 99.04.106.6 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in
its entirety.

5



Sec. 19. Section 99.04.106.7 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

99.04.106.7. Reduction of Heat Island Effect for Nonroof Areas [N]. Reduce
nonroof heat islands for 25 percent of pathways, patios, driveways or other paved
areas by using one or more ofthe methods listed.

1. Trees or other plantings to provide shade and that mature within
5 years of planting. Trees should be native or adaptive to the region and
climate zones and non-invasive; hardy and resista to drought, insects and
disease; easy to maintain (no frequent shedd in igs, branches, unwanted
fruit or seed pods); and suitable in mature siz nvironmental
requirements for the site. Tree selection a ent should consider
location and size of areas to be shaded, .. ies, views from the
structure, distance to sidewalks and s onto adjacent
properties and streets; other infras ndscaping. In
addition, shading shall not cast a s neighboring
solar collectors pursuant to Public R . 1, et seq.
(Solar Shade Control Act);

approved by
of the Los Ange
section 12.22 C.2

tial solar reflectance value
rican Society for Testing

3.
pavement s

underground or use multilevel

elling units constructed on a smalllot(s) subdivision
ency, pursuant to the Division of Land Regulations

I Code (LAM. C.) in conformity with the provisions of
AM.C.

Sec. 20. Section 99.04.106.8 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

99.04.106.8. Electric Vehicle (EV) Charging [N]. Residential buildings shall comply
with the following requirements for the future installation of electric vehicle supply
equipment (EVSE).

99.04.106.8.1. One-and Two-Family Dwellings and Townhomes. Install a listed
raceway to accommodate a dedicated branch circuit. The raceway shall not be less

6



than trade size 1 (nominal 1 inch inside diameter). The raceway shall be securely
fastened at the main service or subpanel and shall terminate in close proximity to the
proposed location of the charging system into a listed cabinet, box or enclosure.
Raceways are required to be continuous at enclosed or concealed areas and spaces.
A raceway may terminate in an attic or other approved location when it can be
demonstrated that the area is accessible and no removal of materials is necessary to
complete the final installation. Sufficient conductor sizing and service capacity to
install Level 2 EVSE shall be provided.

99.04.106.8.1.1. Labeling Requirement. A label statin
posted in a conspicuous place at the service panel or
raceway termination point.

" V CAPABLE" shall be
el and next to the

he total parking
re electric vehicle

hen multiple charging
tion(s) a type of the EVSE,

trical calculations to verify that the
aneously charge all the electrical

eir full rated amperage. Plan
maximum operating ampacity. Only

nd equipment are required to be

99.04.106.8.2.
posted in a cons
space.

uirement. A label stating "EV CAPABLE" shall be
t the service panel or subpanel and the EV charging

Sec. 21.
entirety.

.04.202 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in its

Sec. 22. Section 99.04.203 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in its
entirety.

Sec. 23. Section 99.04.204 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in its
entirety.

Sec. 24. Section 99.04.205 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in its

7



entirety.

Sec. 25. Section 99.04.206 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in its
entirety.

Sec. 26. Section 99.04.207 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in its
entirety.

Sec. 27. Section 99.04.208 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in its
entirety.

SEC. 99.04.211. RENEWABLE

icipal Code is deleted in itsSec. 28. Section 99.04.209 of the Los Angel
entirety.

Sec. 29. Section 99.04.210 of the Lo
entirety.

Sec. 30. Section 99.04.211 of the L
read as follows:

'Iding required to provide a solar zone per Section
ergy Code.

Sec. 31.
its entirety.

03.1 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in

Sec. 32. Table 4.303.1 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in its
entirety.

Sec. 33. Section 99.04.303.1.2 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

99.04.303.1.2. Urinals. The effective flush volume of urinals shall not exceed 0.125
gallons per flush.

8



Sec. 34. Table 4.303.2 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in its
entirety.

Sec. 35. Section 99.04.304.1.1 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is
amended to read as follows:

99.04.304.1.1. Irrigation Design [N]. Buildings on sites with over 2,500 square feet
of cumulative irrigated landscaped areas shall have irrigation controllers which meet
the criteria in Section 99.4.304.1.

SEC. 99.04.406. ENHANCED DURABILITY

ipal Code is amended toSec. 36. Section 99.04.406 of the Los Angeles
read as follows:

99.04.406.1. Rodent Proofing. Annular
conduits or other openings in sole/bottom
against the passage of rodents by closing s
concrete masonry or a similar me hod accept

ctric cables,
be protected

ortar,

Sec. 37. Section 99.04.40
read as follows:

99.04.407.3. Flashi
comply with acce
following locations.

s on building plans which
instructions at the

07.3 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to

99.04.407.4. Materia
construction site from rar

~ on. Protect building materials delivered to the
nd other sources of moisture.

Sec. 39. Section 99.04.408 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

SEC. 99.04.408. CONSTRUCTION WASTE REDUCTION, DISPOSAL AND
RECYCLING.

Section 4.408 of the 2013 California Green Building Standards Code is not adopted.

9



99.04.408.1. Construction Waste Reduction of at Least 50 Percent. Comply with
Section 66.32 et seq. of the Los Angeles Municipal Code.

Sec. 40. The first unnumbered paragraph and Items 1 and 10 of Section
99.04.410.1 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code are amended to read as follows:

99.04.410.1. Operation and Maintenance Manual. At the time of final inspection, a
manual, compact disc, web-based reference or other media acceptable to the
Department, which includes all of the following, shall be placed in the building:

1. Directions to the owner or occupa
with the building throughout the life cycle of the

the manual shall remain
e.

10. A copy of all special inspe
Department or this code.

s required by the

Sec. 41. Section 99.04.504 of the
read as follows:

SEC. 99.04.504. POLLUTANT

. n Of Mechanical
lIation, during storage

. ling and ventilating
ent openings shall be

ethods eptable to the Department
which may enter the system.

liance with this section shall be
umentation may include, but is not

uct specification.

ation of on-site product containers.

99.04.504.5.1. Docu
provided as requested b
of the following:

n. Verification of compliance with this section shall be
e Department. Documentation shall include at least one

1. Product certifications and specifications;

2. Chain of custody certifications;

3. Product labeled and invoiced as meeting the Composite Wood
Products regulation (see CCR, Title 17, Section 93120, et seq.);

10



4. Exterior grade products marked as meeting the PS-1 or PS-2
standards of the Engineered Wood Association, the Australian AS/NZS 2269
or European 636 3S standards; or

5. Other methods acceptable to the Department.

Sec. 42. Section 99.04.505 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to
read as follows:

SEC. 99.04.505. INTERIOR MOISTURE CONTROL.

. dations required to
j 9 or concrete

eles

99.04.505.1. General. Buildings shall meet or exc
Angeles Municipal Code.

99.04.505.2. Concrete Slab Foundations.
have a vapor retarder by the Los Angeles
slap-on-ground floors required to have a
Residential Code, Chapter 5, shall also com

99.04.505.2.1. Capillary break
with at least one of the following:

(12.7 mm) or larger
tar in direct contact with

ss bleeding, shrinkage,
, see American Concrete

roved by the Department.

a licensed design professional.

99.04.505 ..
visible signs 0
be enclosed untl .
Insulation products
replaced or allowed to
insulation products shall
enclosure.

t of ding Materials. Building materials with
all not be installed. Wall and floor framing shall not

and found to be satisfactory by the building inspector.
sibly wet or have a high moisture content shall be

r to enclosure in wall or floor cavities. Wet-applied
ow the manufacturers' drying recommendations prior to

11



Sec. 43. The Title of Division 5 of Article 9 of Chapter IX of the Los Angeles
Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:

ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 5

NONRESIDENTIAL MANDATORY MEASURES

Sec. 44. Section 99.05.100 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

Sec. 46. Section 99.05.1
read as follows:

he loss of soil through
n of erosion and

SEC. 99.05.100. BASIC PROVISIONS.

Chapter 5 of the 2013 California Green
reference except Section 5.408.1 is not ado
added as provided in this Article.

Sec. 45.
its entirety.

99.05.106.1.2. Best
wind or water eros'
sediment control

considered for implementation as
not limited to, the following:

tural features, vegetation and soil;

swales or lined ditches to control stormwater flow;

g or hydroseeding to stabilize disturbed soils;

e. Erosion control to protect slopes;

f. Protection of storm drain inlets (gravel bags or catch basin
inserts);

g. Perimeter sediment control (perimeter silt fence, fiber rolls);

h. Sediment trap or sediment basin to retain sediment on site;

12



i. Stabilized construction exits;

j. Wind erosion control;

k. Other soil loss BMP acceptable to the Department.

2. Good housekeeping BMP to manage construction equipment,
materials and wastes that should be considered for implementation as
appropriate for each project include, but are not limited to, the following:

d. Control of vehicle
area;

b. Building materials stockpil

a. Material handling and waste m

c. Management of wash

e. Vehicle a

g!ll~llt!!l:lilOUseke

in its

ngeles"m-tlnicipal Code is deleted inSec. 47.
its entirety.

ngeles Municipal Code is deleted

of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted

Sec. 50.
in its entirety.

06.5.2 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted

Sec. 51.
entirety.

.5.2 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in its

Sec. 52. Section 99.05.106.5.3 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

99.05.106.5.3. Electric Vehicle Charging [N]. At least 5 percent of the total parking
spaces, but not less than one, shall be capable of supporting installation of future
electric vehicle supply equipment (EVSE). Provide facilities meeting Section 406.7
(Electric Vehicle) of the Los Angeles Building Code and as follows:

13



Sec. 53. Section 99.05.106.5.3.1 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is
amended to read as follows:

99.05.106.5.3.1. Single Charging Space Requirements. When only a single
charging space is required, install a listed raceway capable of accommodating a
dedicated branch circuit. The raceway shall not be less than trade size 1. The
raceway shall be securely fastened at the main service or sub panel and shall
terminate in close proximity to the proposed location of the charging system into a
listed cabinet, box or enclosure. Sufficient conductor sizi and service capacity to
install Level 2 EVSE shall be provided.

Municipal Code is addedSec. 54. Section 99.05.106.5.3.2 of the Lo
to read as follows:

Sec. 55. S
to read as follows:

99.05.106.5
shall be
char'

I stating "EV CHARGE CAPABLE"
ice panel or subpanel and the EV

the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended

99.05.106.8. Li
designed and insta

eduction [N]. Outdoor lighting systems shall be
with the following:

1. The imum requirements in the California Energy Code for
Lighting Zones 1-4 as defined in Chapter 10 of the California Administrative
Code; and

2. Backlight, Uplight and Glare (BUG) ratings as defined in IESTM-
15-11; and

3. Allowable BUG ratings not exceeding those shown in Table
5.106.8, or comply with a local ordinance lawfully enacted pursuant to Section
101.7, whichever is more stringent.

14



EXCEPTIONS [N]:

1. Luminaires that qualify as exceptions in Section 147 of the
California Energy Code;

2. Emergency lighting.

Note [N]: See also Los Angeles Building Code, Division 12, Section 91.1205.6
for college campus lighting requirements for parking facili' s and walkways.

Sec. 56. Table 5.106.8[N] of the Los Angele
as follows:

'pal Code is added to read

RATINGS1.2

LIGHTING
ZONE4

No limit

B4

B3

Luminaire back hemis
MH from property line

B1

Maximu
For ar UO UO
For all ' U3 U4
decorati
Maxim

B2

Luminaire gre G2 G3 G4
line
Luminaire front h GO G1 G1 G2

ro ert line
Luminaire front hemisphe GO GO G1 G1
from ro ert line
Luminaire back hemisphere is less than 0.5 GO GO GO G1
MH from ro ert line

1. IESNA Lighting Zones 0 and 5 are not applicable; refer to Lighting Zones as defined in the
California Energy Code and Chapter 10 of the California Administrative Code.

2. For property lines that abut public walkways, bikeways, plazas and parking lots, the property
line may be considered to be 5 feet beyond the actual property line for purpose of determining
compliance with this section. For property lines that abut public roadways and public transit
corridors, the property line may be considered to be the centerline of the public roadway or
public transit corridor for the purpose of determining compliance with this section.

3. If the nearest property line is less than or equal to two mounting heights from the back
hemisphere of the luminaire distribution, the applicable reduced Backlight rating shall be met

15



4. General lighting luminaires in areas such as outdoor parking, sales or storage lots shall meet
these reduced ratings. Decorative luminaires located in this area shall meet U-value limits for
"all other outdoor lighting".

5. If the nearest property line is less than or equal to two mounting heights from the front
hemisphere of the luminaire distribution, the applicable reduced Glare rating shall be met.

Sec. 57. Section 99.05.106.10 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted
in its entirety.

Sec. 58. Section 99.05.106.11 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

Sec. 63. Se
read as follows:

combination of strategies
arking underground.

99.05.106.11. Hardscape Alternatives [N]. Use 0
below for 25 percent of site hardscape or put 25

1.

flectance value
for Testing

3. Use open-gri
pavement system.

Sec. 59.
entirety.

I Code is deleted in its

Sec. 60.
entirety.

geles Municipal Code is deleted in its

ngeles Municipal Code is deleted in its
entiret

Sec.
entirety.

Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in its

11.1 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to

99.05.211.1. Space for Future Electrical Solar System Installation [N]. Comply
with Section 110.10 of the Califomia Energy Code.

99.05.211.1.1. Prewiring for Future Electrical Solar System [N]. Install conduit
from the building roof, eave, or other locations approved by the Department to the
electrical service equipment. The conduit shall be labeled as per the Los Angeles
Fire Department requirements.

EXCEPTION: Buildings not required to provide a solar zone per Section
16



110.10 of the California Energy Code.

Sec. 64. Section 99.05.211.4 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in
its entirety.

Sec. 65. Section 99.05.211.4.1 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted
in its entirety.

Sec. 66. Section 99.05.302 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted in its
entirety.

Sec. 67. Section 99.05.303.1 of the Los Ang
its entirety.

nicipal Code is deleted in

Sec. 68. Section 99.05.303.2 of the
its entirety.

al Code is deleted in

Sec. 69.
in its entirety.

e is deleted

, Sec. 70. Table 5.303.2.2
entirety.

Sec. 71.
entirety.

ode is deleted in its

s Angeles Municipal Code is added to

99.05
gallon

ume of urinals shall not exceed 0.125

he Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended

99.05.303.4. Was
wastewater by one 0

uction [N]. Each building shall reduce by 20 percent
ing methods:

1. [BSC, DSA-SS] The installation of water-conserving fixtures
(water closets, urinals) meeting the criteria established in Section 5.303.2 or
5.303.3.

2. [BSC] Utilizing non potable water systems [captured rainwater,
graywater, and municipally treated wastewater (recycled water) complying with
the current edition of the Los Angeles Plumbing Code or other methods
described in Section A5.304.8].

17



Sec. 74. Section 99.05.303.6 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

99.05.303.6. Standards for Plumbing Fixtures and Fittings. Plumbing fixtures
and fittings shall be installed in accordance with the Los Angeles Plumbing Code, and
shall meet the applicable standards referenced in Table 1401.1 of the Los Angeles
Plumbing Code and in Chapter 6.of this Code.

Sec. 75. Section 99.05.304 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to
read as follows:

99.05.304.2. Outdoor Potable Water Use. F
alteration requiring upgraded water service f
square, separate submeters or metering
water use.

service or for addition or
of at least 1,000

or outdoor potable

SEC. 99.05.304. OUTDOOR WATER USE.

99.05.304.3.1. Irrig
installed at the tim

tem controllers
following:

- or soil moisture-based controllers
nse to changes in plants' needs as

co
wire
contro
sensor in

controlle s without integral rain sensors or
ount for local rainfall shall have a separate

nsor h connects or communicates with the
e-based controllers are not required to have rain

Note: More in
specifications is availabl

regarding irrigation controller function and
om the Irrigation Association.

Sec. 76. Section 99.05.408 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to
read as follows:

99.5.408.1. Construction Waste Diversion. Comply with Section 66.32 et seq. of
the Los Angeles Municipal Code.

Sec. 77. Section 99.05.408.3 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

18



99.05.408.3. Excavated Soil And Land Clearing Debris [BSC]. 100 percent of
trees, stumps, rocks and associated vegetation and soils resulting primarily from land
clearing shall be reused or recycled. For a phased project, such material may be
stockpiled on site until the storage site is developed.

EXCEPTION: Reuse, either on-or off-site, of vegetation or soil
contaminated by disease or pest infestation.

Notes:

Sec. 78.
its entirety.

1. If contamination by disease or pe
contact the County Agricultural Commissione
recycling or disposal of the material. (www
county/county contacts.html)

tation is suspected,
lIow its direction for
v/execl

2. For a map of known
consult with the California Depart
(www.cdfa.ca.gov)

3. Contaminat
or remediated in accordan

Sec. 79. S
to read as follows:

nicipal Code is amended

99.05.4
the e
haza
cardbo
ordinance, I

readily accessible areas that serve
ositing, storage and collection of non-

cluding t a minimum) paper, corrugated
. r meet a lawfully enacted local recycling

itions within a tenant space resulting in less than a
nt space floor area .

Sec.80.
in its entirety.

.05.410.2.5 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted

Sec. 81. The first unnumbered paragraph of Section 99.05.410.2.5.1 of the
Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:

99.05.410.2.5.1. Systems Manual [N]. Documentation of the operational aspects of
the building shall be completed within the systems manual and delivered to the
building owner or representative. The systems manual shall include the following:

19



Sec. 82. Section 99.05.410.4.5 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted
in its entirety.

Sec. 83. Section 99.05.504.3 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended
to read as follows:

99.05.504.3. Covering of Duct Openings and Protection of Mechanical
Equipment During Construction. At the time of rough installation and during
storage on the construction site until final startup of the heating, cooling and
ventilating equipment, all duct and other related air distrib ion component openings
shall be covered with tape, plastic, sheetmetal or other ods acceptable to the
Department to reduce the amount of dust, water an which may enter the
system.

Sec. 84. Section 99.05.504.4.3.2 of t
amended to read as follows:

n shall be
. t is not

99.05.504.4.3.2. Verification. Verification
provided at the request of the De artment. Do
limited to, the following:

1.

2.

Sec. 85. S
deleted in its entirety.

Angeles Municipal Code is added
to re

99.05.50
be provide
one of the foil

ification of compliance with this section shall
ent. Documentation shall include at least

1. ifications and specifications;

2. f custody certifications;

3. Product labeled and invoiced as meeting the Composite Wood
Products regulation (see CCR, Title 17, Section 93120, et seq);

4. Exterior grade products marked as meeting the PS-1 or PS-2
standards of the Engineered Wood Association, the Australian AS/NZS 2269
or European 636 3S standards; or

5. Other methods acceptable to the Department.

20



Sec. 87. Section 99.05.504.4.6 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is deleted
in its entirety.

Sec. 88. Section 99.05.504.7 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended
to read as follows:

99.05.504.7. Environmental Tobacco Smoke (ETS) Control. Where outdoor
areas are provided for smoking, prohibit smoking within 25 feet of building entries,
outdoor air intakes and operable windows and within the building as already
prohibited by other laws or regulations; or as enforced by dinances, regulations or
policies of the City, whichever are more stringent. Whe nances, regulations or
policies are not in place, post signage to inform buil . upants of the prohibitions.

Sec. 91. Section 99.05.5
in its entirety.

. al Code is deleted in itsSec. 89. Section 99.05.505 of the Los
entirety.

Sec. 90. Section 99.05.507 of the
entirety.

IS deleted

. al Code is added to

SEC. 99.05.508.

99.05.508.
Codes
using
tubin
except a

'ant with the Los Angeles Mechanical
rotection and repairs. Piping runs

with ide diameter (OD) less than %", flared
elbows s all not be used in refrigerant systems

99.05.508.2.2.
Mechanical Cod

and fittings shall comply with the Los Angeles

Sec. 93. Secti
to read as follows:

.601.1 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended

99.06.601.1. General. Chapter 6 of the 2013 California Green Building Standards
Code is adopted in its entirety.

21



Sec. 94. Section 99.07.100 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

SEC. 99.07.100. BASIC PROVISIONS.

Chapter 7 of the 2013 California Green Building Standards Code is adopted by
reference except as amended herein.

Sec. 95. Section 99.07.701 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is added to
read as follows:

SEC. 99.07.701.

99.07.701.1. General. Chapter 7 of the 2013
Code is adopted by reference with the folio .
and 702.3, and in lieu, Sections 99.07.70
as provided in this Article.

n Building Standards
tions 702.1, 702.2

7.702.3 are added

Sec. 96. The first unnumb
Angeles Municipal Code is amen

the Los

99.07.702.2. Special Inspection
Department, the owner or the respo
employ one or more
necessary to subs
demonstrate com
type of inspection or
qualificatio ptab
educati sid
a spe

s. When required by the
owner's agent shall

other duties
I Inspectors shall

e enfor ..g agency for the particular
dition to other certifications or
, the following certifications or

hen evaluating the qualifications of

aragraph of Section 99.07.702.3 of the Los
ead as follows:

99.07.702.3. Sp ns for Non-Residential Buildings. When required
by the Department, .r the responsible entity acting as the owner's agent
shall employ one or cial inspectors to provide inspection or other duties
necessary to substantiat mpliance with this code. Special inspectors shall
demonstrate competence to the satisfaction of the Department for the particular type
of inspection or task to be performed. In addition, the special inspector shall have a
certification from a recognized state, national or international association, as
determined by the Department. The area of certification shall be closely related to the
primary job function, as determined by the Department.

22



Sec. 98. Section 99.07.703 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended to
read as follows:

SEC. 99.07.703. VERIFICATION.

99.07.703.1. Documentation. Documentation used to show compliance with this
code shall include but is not limited to, construction documents, plans, specifications,
builder or installer certification, inspection reports, or other methods acceptable to the
Department which demonstrate substantial conformance. When specific
documentation or special inspection is necessary to veri ompliance, that method of
compliance will be specified in the appropriate section ntified in the application
checklist.

Angeles MunicipalSec. 99. Division 9 of Article 9 of Chapt
Code is deleted in its entirety and amended

MANDATORY MEASURES FO
RES

SEC. 99.09.100. SCOPE.

OW-RISE

s Code is adopted.

ADDITIONS AND ALTERATIONS TO
-RISE RESIDENTIAL BUILDINGS

.California Green Building Standards Code is adopted.

Sec. 101. The Title of Division 11 of Article 9 of Chapter IX of the Los Angeles
Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:

ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 11
Appendix A4

RESIDENTIAL VOLUNTARY MEASURES

23



Sec. 102. Section 99.11.101 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended
to read as follows:

SEC. 99.11.101. SCOPE.

Appendix A4 of the 2013 California Green Building Standards Code is adopted
by reference with the following exceptions: Sections A4.105.2, A4.106.2.3,
A4.106.5.3, A4.106.7, A4.106.B, A4.106.B.1, A4.106.B.1.1, A4.106.B.2,
A4.106.B.2.1, A4.106.B.2.2, A4.106.B.2.3, A4.303.2, A4.303.4, A4.304.2,
A4.305.1, A4.305.2, A4.403.1, A4.404.1, A4.404.3, A 05.1, A4.405.2,
A4.405.4, A4.407.1, A4.407.3, A4.407.4, A4.407.5, 7.6, A4.407.7,
A4.40B.1,and, in lieu, Sections 99.11.102.A4.105.2 .102.A4.106.2.3,
99.11.102.A4.106.7, 99.11.102.A4.106.B, 99.11.1 .B.2,99.11.102.
A4.106.B.2.1, 99.11.102.A4.106.B.2.2, 99.11.1 , 99.11.102.A4.303.2,
99.11.102.A4.303.4, 99.11.102.A4.304.2, 9 9.11.102.A4.305.2,
99.11.102.A4.404.3, 99.11.102.A4.405.1, 1.102.A4.405.4,
99.11.102.A4.407.1,99.11.102.A4.407.5, 102.A4.407.7,
and 99.11.102.A4.40B.1and Tables A4.10 . 6.5.1(3) and
A4.106.5.1(4) are added as provi d in this A

Sec. 103. Section 99.11.1
read as follows:

SEC. 99.11.102. G

This sectio

minimu
the pt
follow

efurbished or reused materials for a
n estimated cost of materials on

include but are not limited to the

2.

3.

4. Masonry (reused masonry may only be used for flatwork);

5. Electrical devices;

6. Appliances;

7. Foundations or portions of foundations.

24



Note: Reused material must be in compliance with the appropriate Title
24 requirements.

A4.106.2.3. Topsoil Protection. Topsoil shall be protected or saved for reuse as
specified in this section.

Tier 1. Displaced topsoil shall be stockpiled for reuse in a designated
area and covered or protected from erosion.

,,2: 12

Note: Protection from erosion includes cov
mulch, chipped wood, vegetative cover, or other
Department to protect the topsoil for later us

ing with tarps, straw,
s acceptable to the

Tier 2. The construction area sh
fencing or flagging to limit constructio
equipment or vehicle traffic and m
shall be limited to areas that are p

and delineated by
truction area. Heavy

construction area

,,2: 12

ROOF
SLOPE

> 2: 12

.5.1 (2)
SIDENTIAL

SOLAR THERMAL
EMITTANCE

0.85
0.85

TIER 1 -
ROOF
SLOPE

TAB!.: A4.106.5.1(3)
ENTIAL BUILDINGS, HOTELS, AND MOTELS

INIMUM 3·YEAR AGED SOLAR THERMAL SRI
REFLECTANCE EMITTANCE

0.68 0.85 82
>2: 12 0.28 0.85 27

TABLE A4.1 06.5.1 (4)
TIER 2 • HIGH-RISE RESIDENTIAL BUILDINGS, HOTELS, AND MOTELS

ROOF MINIMUM 3·YEAR AGED SOLAR THERMAL SRISLOPE REFLECTANCE EMITTANCE
,,2: 12 0.70 0.85 85
>2: 12 0.34 0.85 35

25



A4.1 06.7. Reduction of Heat Island Effect for Nonroof Areas. Reduce nonroof
heat islands for 75 percent of sidewalks, patios, driveways or other paved areas by
using one or more of the methods listed.

1. Trees or other plantings to provide shade and that mature within
15 years of planting. Trees should be native or adaptive to the region and
climate zones and non-invasive; hardy and resistant to drought, insects and
disease; easy to maintain (no frequent shedding of twigs, branches, unwanted
fruit or seed pods); and suitable in mature size and environmental
requirements for the site. Tree selection and plac ent should consider
location and size of areas to be shaded, locatio ilities, views from the
structure, distance to sidewalks and foundatio hangs onto adjacent
properties and streets; other infrastructure nt to landscaping. In
addition, shading shall not cast a shado on any neighboring
solar collectors pursuant to Public Re . n 25981, et seq.
(Solar Shade Control Act);

4.
parking; or

eat island effects acceptable to the

A4.106.B.2. Mu
but not less than 0
equipment (EVSE).

ngs. At least 10 percent of the total parking spaces,
apable of supporting future electric vehicle supply

A4.106.B.2.1. Single Charging Space Required. When only a single charging
space is required, install a listed raceway capable of accommodating a dedicated
branch circuit. The raceway shall not be less than trade size 1(nominaI1-inch inside
diameter). The raceway shall be securely fastened at the main service or subpanel
and shall terminate in close proximity to the proposed location of the charging system
into a listed cabinet, box or enclosure. Sufficient conductor sizing and service
capacity to install Level 2 EVSE shall be provided.

26



A4.106.S.2.2. Multiple Charging Spaces Required. When multiple charging
spaces are required, plans shall include the location(s) and type of the EVSE,
raceway method(s), wiring schematics and electrical calculations to verify that the
electrical system has sufficient capacity to simultaneously charge all the electrical
vehicles at all designated EV charging spaces at their full rated amperage. Plan
design shall be based upon Level 2 EVSE at its maximum operating ampacity. Only
underground raceways and related underground equipment are required to be
installed at the time of construction.

A4.106.S.2.3. Labeling Requirement. A label stating "E
posted in a conspicuous place at the service panel or
space.

CAPABLE" shall be
el and the EV charging

A4.303.2. Alternate Water Sources for Non
nonpotable water sources are used for indo
nonpotable water sources shall be install
Plumbing Code.

.ations. Alternate
ction. Alternate

Los Angeles

r supplied

rainwater catchment
y at least 65 percent of
designed and installed

ing is installed to permit the
es to be used for an irrigation system

e.

Based projected availability, dual water
cled water at the following locations:

ng for e use of recycled water is installed to serve
nd floor drains.

2. ing is installed to transport recycled water from the
point of connecti () the structure. Recycled water systems shall be designed
and installed in accordance with the Los Angeles Plumbing Code.

A4.404.3. Building Systems. Use premanufactured building systems to eliminate
solid sawn lumber whenever possible. One or more of the following premanufactured
building systems is used throughout:

1. Composite floor joist or premanufactured floor framing system;

2. Composite roof rafters or premanufactured roof framing system;

27



3. Panelized (SIPS, ICF or similar) wall framing system;

4. Other methods approved by the Department.

A4.40S.1. Prefinished Building Materials. Utilize prefinished building materials
which do not require additional painting or staining. One or more of the following
building materials that do not require additional resources for finishing are used:

A4.40S.4. Use of.
more of the follow
agricultural by-produ .
on estimated st of m

1. Exterior trim not requiring paint or

2. Windows not requiring paint

3. Siding or exterior wall c
stain.

nd structural
ing but not

d maintain any acoustical
icipal Code.

a Ie Sources. One or
m rapi enewable sources or
f 2.5 percent of the total value, based

4.

5. Other products acceptable to the enforcing agency.

Note: The intent of this section is to utilize building materials and products
which are typically harvested within a 1O-year or shorter cycle.

A4.407.1. Drainage Around Foundations. Where not required by code or
ordinance, install foundation and landscape drains which discharge to a dry well,
sump, bioswale or other approved on-site location.

28



A4.407.6. Door Protection. Exterior doors to the dwelling are covered to prevent
water intrusion by one or more of the following:

1. A non-retractable awning at least 4 feet in depth is installed;

2. The door is protected by a roof overhang at least 4 feet in depth;

3. The door is recessed at least 4 feet;

4. Other methods which provide equiva

Sec. 104. 1:
Municipal Code is

ngeles Municipal Code, a
t in depth is provided at

A4.407.7. Roof Overhangs. When permitted by t
permanent overhang or non-retractable awning
all exterior walls.

A4.40S.1. Enhanced Construction Was
and demolition debris generated at the si
compliance with one of the following:

dous construction
Ivage in

Tier 1. At least a 6

VOLUNTARY MEASURES

Sec. 105.
to read as follows:

101 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code is amended

SEC. 99.12.101. SCQ

Appendix A5 of the 2013 California Green Building Standards Code is adopted
by reference with the following exceptions: Sections A5.1 05.1.1, A5.1 05.1.2,
A5.106.4.3, A5.106.5.3.3, A5.106.5.3.4, A5.106.6.1, A5.106.11.2, A5.211.1,
A5.303.2.3.4, A5.304.2.1, A5.304.4.2, A5.304.8, A5.305.1, A5.404.1, A5.404.1.1,
A5.405.3, A5.405.5.2, A5.405.5.2.1, A5.406.1, A5.406.1.1, A5.406.1.3, A5.41 0.3,
A5.504.4.9, A5.602 and, in lieu, Sections 99.12.102.A5.105.1.1,
99.12.102.A5.105.1.2, 99.12.102.A5.1 06.4.3, 99.12.102.A5.106.5.3.3,
99.12.102.A5.106.5.3.4, 99.12.102.A5.106.6.1, 99.12.102.A5.106.11.2,

29



99.12.102.A5.211.1, 99.12.102.A5.303.2.3.4, 99.12.102.A5.304.2.1,
99.12.102.A5.304.4.2, 99.12.102.A5.304.8, 99.12.102.A5.305.1, 99.12.102.A5.404.1,
99.12.102.A5.404.1.1, 99.12.102.A5.405.3, 99.12.102.A5.405.5.2,
99.12.102.A5.405.5.2.1, 99.12.102.A5.406.1, 99.12.102.A5.410.3,
99.12.102.A5.504.4.9, 99.12.102.A5.602 and Tables A5.106.4.3, A5.106.5.1.1,
A5.1 06.5.1.2, A5.1 06.11.2.2, A51 06.11.2.3, A5.601 and A5.602 are added as
provided in this Article.

A5.105.1.1. Existing Building structures. Maintain at least 75 percent of existing
building structure (including structural floor and rood deck' ) and envelope (exterior
skin and framing) based on surface area.

NUMBER OF
TENANT-

OCCUPANTS

EXCEPTIONS:

1.

2.
project.

A5.105.1.2. Existing Non-Stru
nonstructural elements (interior w
least 50 percent of the area of the

A5.106.4.3. Chan
occupants only in
nearby changing/s

lities for tenant-
. ment arrangements with

TABLE A5.106.4.3

2-TIER (12" X 15" X 72") PERSONAL
EFFECTS LOCKERSREQUIRED

1 unisex shower 11-10

1 unisex shower 211-50
51-100 1 unisex shower 3
101-200 1 shower stall er ender 4

Over 200
1 shower stall per gender for each
200 additional tenant-occupants

One 2-tier locker for each 50 additional
tenant-occupants

Note: Additional information on recommended bicycle accommodations may be obtained from
Sacramento Area Bicycle Advocates

30



A5.106.5.1.1. Tier 1. Designated parking spaces [BSC]. Provide designated
parking spaces for any combination of low-emitting, fuel-efficient and carpoollvan
pool vehicles as follows:

TABLE A5.106.5.1.1
TOTAL NUMBER

OF PARKING SPACES
0-9

NUMBER
OF REQUIRED SPAC~S'--_-1

10-25
26-50
51-75

76-100
101-150
151-200

201 ancL9veC L

A5.106.5.1.2. Tier 2. Designat
spaces for any combination of 10
vehicles as follows:

N R
F REQUIRED SPACES

1
2
5

9

'-----""----i---i-----'1.3"--------i
19

At least 12 ercent of total

A5.106.5.3.3. Tier 1.
one, shall be capable of
equipment (EVSE).

7 percent of the total parking spaces, but not less than
pporting installation of future electric vehicle supply

A5.106.5.3.4. Tier 2. At least 10 percent of the total parking spaces, but not less
than two, shall be capable of supporting installation of future EVSE.

A5.106.6.1. Reduce Parking Capacity. With the approval of the enforcement
authority, employ strategies to reduce on-site parking area by 20%.

31



1. Use of on street parking or compact spaces, illustrated on
the site plan; or

2. Implementation and documentation of programs that
encourage occupants to carpool, ride share or use altemate
transportation.

Note: Strategies for programs may be obtained from local TMAs .

AS.106.11.1.1. Hardscape Alternatives. Use one or a
and 2 for 75 percent of site hardscape or put 75 per

.bination of strategies 1
arking underground.

1. Use light colored m
reflectance value of at least .30
American Society for Testing
or C 1549.

an initial solar
ccordance with

Standards E 1918

2. Use open-grid pa
permeable pavem

feet. Use roofing materials
ce complying with

olar Reflectance Index
Ie A5.1 06.11.2.2 for

0.85 82

THERMAL
EMITTANCE SRI

0.85 27

ROOF MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED SOLAR THERMAL SRISLOPE REFLECTANCE EMITTANCE

< 2: 12 1-16 0.70 0.85 85
>2: 12 1-16 0.34 0.85 35

TABLE AS.106.11.2.3
TIER 2

AS.211.1. On-Site Renewable Energy. Use on-site renewable energy sources such
as solar, wind, geothermal, low-impact hydro, biomass andbio-gas for at least 1
percent of the electric power calculated as the product of the building service voltage

32



and the amperage specified by the electrical service over current protection
device rating or 1kW, (whichever is greater), in addition to the electrical demand
required to meet 1 percent of the natural gas and propane use. The building project's
electrical service over current protection device rating shall be calculated in
accordance with the Los Angeles Electrical Code. Natural gas or propane use is
calculated in accordance with the Los Angeles Plumbing Code.

AS.303.2.3.4. Nonpotable Water Systems for Indoor Water Use. Utilizing
nonpotable water systems (such as captured rainwater, treated graywater, and
recycled water) intended to supply water closets, urinals, d other allowed uses,
may be used in the calculations demonstrating the 30- r 40-percent reduction.
The nonpotable water system shall comply with the edition of the Los Angeles
Plumbing Code.

AS.304.2.1. Outdoor Potable Water Use.
provisions of Section 5.304.2, separate
indoor and outdoor potable water use for

not subject to the
e installed for

AS.304.4.2. Tier 2. Reduce the
exceed 55 percent of ETo times'

es not

this section must be
de and shall include,

1.

ed for irrigation purposes and conveyed by a water

6.

AS.304.S. Graywater Irrigation System. Install a graywater collection system for
onsite subsurface irrigation using graywater collected from bathtubs, showers,
bathroom wash basins and laundry water. See Los Angeles Plumbing Code.

A5.305.1. Nonpotable Water Systems. Nonpotable water systems for indoor and
outdoor use shall comply with the current edition of the Los Angeles Plumbing Code.

AS.404.1. Wood Framing. Employ advanced wood framing techniques or OVE, as
recommended by the U.S. Department of Energy's Office of Building Technology,

33



State and Community Programs and as permitted by the Department.

A5.404.1.1. Structural or Fire-Resistance Integrity. The OVE selected shall not
conflict with structural framing methods or fire-rated assemblies required by the Los
Angeles Building Code.

A5.405.3. Reused Materials. Use salvaged, refurbished, refinished or reused
materials for a minimum of 5 percent of the total value, based on estimated cost of
materials on the project. Provide documentation as to the respective values. All
materials shall comply with the Los Angeles Municipal Co e.

A5.405.5.2. Concrete. Unless otherwise di
concrete manufactured with cementitious
A5.405.5.2.1 and A5.405.5.2.1.1, as appr

Note: Sources of some reused materials ca
also Appendix A5, Division A5.1, Section A

ound at CalRecycle. See
r on-site materials reuse.

er of Record, use
ith Sections

A5.405.5.2.1. Supplementary C
made with one or more supplem
the following standards:

rete
rming to

ification for Coal Fly
Concrete;

ASTM C 989,

M C 1240, Specification for Silica

nforming to ASTM C 618, Specification for
d Natural Pozzolan for Use in Concrete;

5. pplementary cementitious materials conforming to
ASTM C 16 Specification for Blended Supplementary
Cementitious s. The amount of each SCM in the blend will be used
separately in cal ting Equation A5.4-1. If Class C fly ash is used in the
blend, it will be considered to be "SL" for the purposes of satisfying the
equation;

6. Ultra-fine fly ash (UFFA) conforming to ASTM C 618, Specification
for Coal Fly Ash and Raw or Calcined Natural Pozzolan for Use in Concrete
and the following chemical and physical requirements:

[ PercentLChemical Requirements

34



Sulfur Trioxide (SO,) r 1.5 max.

Expansion at 16 days when testing job
materials in conformance with ASTM C 1567

* In the test mix, cement shall be replaced

7. Metakaolin conform'
Fly Ash and Raw or Calcined Natu
following chemical and physical requ

50
90

95 (minimum
% of control)
10 (minimum

of control)

0.10 max.

UFFA by weight.

. ication for Coal
rete, the

Percent

95

100 (minimum
% of control)
100 (minimum
%ofcont~

rials with comparable or superior environmental
y the Engineer of Record and Department.

A5.40S.1. Choice of Materials. Compared to other products in a given product
category, choose materials proven to be characterized by one or more of the
following for a minimum of 5 percent of the total value, based on estimated cost of
materials on the project.

A5.410.3. Commissioning. For new buildings under 10,000 square feet, building
commissioning shall be included in the design and construction processes of the
building project to verify that the building systems and components meet the owner's or
owner representative's project requirements. Commissioning shall be performed in

35



accordance with this section by trained personnel with experience on projects of
comparable size and complexity. Commissioning requirements shall include:

1. Owner's or owner representative's project requirements;

2. Basis of design;

3. Commissioning measures shown in the construction documents;

4. Commissioning plan;

5. Functional performance testing;

6. Documentation and trainin

7.

All building operating systems covered by Ti
equipment and controls and renewable energy
of the commissioning requireme

Iy with Chapter 8 in Title
mission limits defined in

ucts Database.

Energy Performance2
•
3

Meet Table A5.106.5.1.1 Meet Table A5.106.5.1.2

Meet all of the provisions of Meet all of the provisions of
Chapter 5 Chapter 5II

Meet Table A5.106.11.2.2 Meet Table A5.106.11.2.3

1 additional Elective from 3 additional Electives from
Division A5.1 Division A5.1

Energy Efficiency Outdoor lighting power 90% Outdoor lighting power 90%
of Part 6 allowance of Part 6 allowance

If applicable, solar water- If applicable, solar water-
heating system with heating system with

minimum solar savings minimum solar savings
If applicable, certain If applicable, certain

unctional areas comply with functional areas comply with
I- I- -i'--'.;re"'s""id""e!.!:nt"'ia"-I",in",d"oo",r,2l""i!!,ht",in...,.residential indoor Ii htin

Energy Budget 95% or 90% Energy Budget 90% or 85%
of Part 6 allowance of Part 6 allowance

36



ater Efficiency and
fonservation

Indoor Water Use

Outdoor Water Use

Material Conservation
nd Resource

4
Efficiency

Construction Waste
Reduction

30% Savings 35% Savings

Not exceed 60% of ETo Not exceed 55% ofocE=T=-o---i
times the landsca e area times the land~cJme area
1 additional Elective from 3 additional Electives from

Division A5.3 __-f__ -"Qivision A5.3

At least 65% reduction At least 80% reduction

dditional Electives

Utilize recycled content Utilize recycled content
materials for 10% of total materials for 15% of total

mat . st material cost
f---------f-----------h1-=a:-:;dc:;d"'iti"'0"" tive from 3 additional Electives from

5.4 Division A5.4 _
eets VOC 100% of flooring meets VOC

limits'._
Install no-add'-e-:-d---I

formaldehyde insulation and
comply VOC limits

Recycled Content

Environmental Quality Low-VOC Resilient Flooring 90%

Low-VOC Thermal
Insulation

dditional Measures

pproximate Total
Measures

1. Exception: Allowance ma
Exceptions for solar wat
2. Buildings with a na
3. Buildings where gre
than 70 percent. Solar ac
without shad 'ng from
be includ . atio
4. Life lian
prescri . ion

1. Green build
county as specifi
2. Required prerequi
3. These measures are

additional Electives from
Division (\5=.5__ -1

24
~--;c--L..--;:---c-------J

5-percent thermal efficiency.
f area has nual solar access that is less
n including shade to the solar insolation

f or any other part of the building shall not

In this code may be substituted for

mandatory if adopted by a city, county, or city and

ired elsewhere in statute or in regulation.

37



o
·.!L.;.

A5.103.1 Community connectivity. Locate project on a prev
developed site within a '/2 mile radius of at least ten basic servl
listed in Section AB.1 03.1.

o
A5.103.2 Brownfield or greyfield site redevelopment 0
area development. Select for development a brownfiel
accordance with Section AB.1 03.2.1 or on a greyfiel
defined in Section AB.1 02.

A5.103.3.1 Brownfield redevelopment. Dev
documented as contaminated and fully reme
defined as a brownfield.

o o

o 0

o 0

o

A5.1
perc

, roof
surfa

Exce
1. Wi
2. Haza

project.
3. A project ore than two times the square

footage of the g.
A5.105.1.2 Existing n I elements. Reuse existing
interior nonstructural elem nterior walls, doors, floor coverings
and ceiling systems) in at least BO percent of the area of the
completed building (including additions).
A5.1 05.1.3 Salvage. Salvage additional items in good condition
such as light fixtures, plumbing fixtures and doors for reuse on this
project in an onsite storage area or for salvage in dedicated
collection bins. Document the weight or number of the items
salva

o

o

o

o

o

o

38



VOLUNTARY'
CALGreen CALGreen

APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR BSC MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2
5.106.1 Storm water pollution prevention. Newly constructed
projects which disturb less than one acre of land shall prevent the
pollution of stormwater runoff from the construction activities
through best management practices (BMP) in Section 5.106.1.2
A5.106.2 Storm water design. Design storm water runoff rate and
quantity in conformance with Section A5. 106.3. 1 and storm water
runoff quality by Section A5.1 06.3.2 or by local requirements.
whichever are stricter.

A5.106.2.1 Storm water runoff rate and quantity. Implement
storm water management plan resu Iting in no net increase in
and quantity of storm water runoff from existing to develo
conditions.

Exception: If the site is already greater than 50 per
impervious, implement a storm water managem
resulting in a 25 percent decrease in rate and

A5.106.2.2 Storm water runoff quality. Use
treatment control best management practices
(infiltrate, filter or treat) storm water runoff from
percentile 24-hour runoff event (for volume-based
runoff produced by a rain event eq two times t
percentile hourly intensity (for flow Ps)..

A5.106.3 Low impact development ( peak ru
compliance with Section 5.106.3.1. Em of the
following methods or other best managem low
rainwater to soak into th evaporat ct .
storage receptacles f ther ben
strategies include, b 0 those I
A5.106.4.
5.106.4 Bicycle parki
5.106.4.2; or t local or

5.106 bic
anti' . ito
an in 20
rea for 5
vehicl mini
capacity
5.106.4.2 L
10 tenant-occu
of tenant-occupie
minimum of one sp

A5.106.4.3 Changing r buildings with over 10 tenant-
occupants, provide changin ower facilities in accordance with
Table A5.1 06.4.3 or document arrangements with nearby
changing/shower facilities.

rking. For buildings with over
re bicycle parking for 5 percent
Ie parking capacity, with a

A5.106.5.1 Designated parking for fuel-efficient vehicles-:
Provide designated parking for any combination of low-emitting,
fuel-efficient and carpool/van pool vehicles as shown in:

A5.106.5.1.1. Tier 1 spacesperTableA5.106.5.1.1
A5.106.5.1.2. Tier 2 spaces per Table A5.1 06.5.1.2

5.106.5.2 Designated parking. Provide designated parking for any
combination of low-emitting, fuel-efficient and carpool/van pool
vehicles as shown in Table 5.106.6.2.-----

D

D

D

D

D

D D

39

D



VOLUNTARY

o

APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR esc
CALGreen CALGreen

MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2
A5.106.5.3.1 Single charging space requirements. When only a
single charging space is required, install a listed raceway capable of
accommodating a dedicated branch circuit. The raceway shall not
be less than trade size 1. The raceway shall be securely fastened at
the main service or subpanel and shall terminate in close proximity
to the proposed location of the charging system into a listed
cabinet, box, or enclosure.

Exception: Other pre-installation methods approved by the local
enforcing agency that provide sufficient conductor sizing and
service capacity to install Level 2 EVSE.

A5.106.5.3.2 Multiple charging spaces required. When mu
charging spaces are required, plans shall include the locat
and type of the EVSE, raceway method(s), wiring sche
electrical calculations to verify that the electrical syste
sufficient capacity to charge simultaneously all the
vehicles at all designated EV charging spaces
amperage. Plan design shall be based upon Le
maximum operating ampacity. Provide raceways
service panel to the designated parking areas which
be installed at the time of constructio

Note: Utilities and local enforcing
requirements for metering and EVS
consulted during the project design a

A5.106.5.3.3 Tier 1. At least 3 percent of
but not less than one, s able of s
future EVSE.
AS.106.5.3.5 Tier 2
but not less than two,
future EVSE.
A5.106.S.3.S Labeling r
CAPABL sted

anel
AS.
not

AS.10
enforce
parking ar

1. Use ofo
the site plan

2. Implementatio
encourage occup
transportation.

mpact spaces, illustrated on

tation of programs that
rpool, ride share or use alternate

40

o

o 0

o 0

o 0

o 0
o 0



CALGreen CALGreen
MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR BSC

A5.106.7 Exterior walls. Meet requirements in the current edition
of the California Energy Code and comply with either Section
A5.106.7.1 or A5.106.7.2 for wall surfaces:

A5.106.7.1 Fenestration. Provide vegetative or man-made
shading devices for all fenestration on east-, south- and west-
facing walls.

A5.106.7.1.1 East and west walls. Shading devices shall
have 30% coverage to a height of 20 feet or to the top of the
exterior wall, whichever is less.
A5.106.7.1.2 South walls. Shading devices shall have 60%
coverage to a height of 20 feet or to the top of the exteri
whichever is less.

A5.106.7.2 Opaque wall areas. Use wall surfacing with
(aged), for 75% of opaque wall areas. _.-;----;~

5.106.8 Light pollution reduction. [N] Outdoor Ii
shall be designed and installed to comply with t

1. The minimum requirements in the Caliform
Lighting Zones 1-4 as defined in Chapter 10
Administrative Code; and

2. Backlight, Uplight and Glare (B
IESNA TM-15-11; and

3. Allowable BUG ratings not excee
5.106.8, or

Comply with a local ordinance lawfully ena
101.7, whichever is more t.

Exceptions: [N]
1. Luminaires th

California Ener
2. Emergency ligh

or

5.106.10 G and p
how site ainag
flows ter
to m elude'
exceptl ns.

all indicate
ace water
f methods

s 1-5. See

41

VOLUNTARY

o 0

o 0

o 0



VOLUNTARY
CALGreen CALGreen

MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR SSC
5.106.11 Heat island effect. Reduce nonroofheat islands and roof

heat islands as follows:
5.106.11.1 Hardscape alternatives. Use one or a combination of

strategies 1 through 3 for 50 percent of site hardscape or put 50
percent of parking underground.

1. Provide shade (mature within 5 years of occupancy).
2. Use light colored materials with an initial solar reflectance
value of at least .30 as determined in accordance with ASTM
Standards E 1918 or C 1549.
3. Use open-grid pavement system or pervious or permea
pavement system.

AS.106.11.1.1 Hardscape alternatives. Use one or a co
of strategies 1 and 2 for 75 percent of site hardscape
percent of parking underground.

1. Use light colored materials with an initial so
value of at least .30 as determined in accor
Standards E 1918 or C 1549.
2. Use open-grid pavement system or pervio
pavement system.

A5.106.11.2 Cool roof. Use roofin
3-year aged solar reflectance, the
Sections A5.1 06.11.2.1 and A5.1 06.
Solar Reflectance Index (SRI)3 equal
values shown in:

Table A5.106.11.2.
Table A5.106.11
Exceptions:
1. Roof constr

membrane, incl
weighi at least

2. r

o 0

o 0

o 0

5.201.1 Scope. Building meets or exceeds the requirements of the
California Building Energy Efficiency Standards:

5.203.1 Energy Efficiency. Nonresidential, high-rise residential
and hotel/motel buildings that include lighting and/or mechanical

ystems shall comply with Sections A5.203. 1.1 and either
5.203.1.2.1 or A5.203.1.2.2. Newly constructed buildings as well

as additions and alterations are included in the scope of these
sections. Buildings permitted without lighting or mechanical systems
shall comply with Section A5.203.1.1 but are not required to comply

ith Sections A5.203. 1.1.2 or A5.203. 1.2.

o o

5.203.1.1.1 Outdoor Lighting. Newly installed outdoor lighting
power is no greater than 90 percent of the Title 24, Part 6 calculated
alue of allowed outdoor lighting power.
5.203.1.1.2 Service Water Heating in Restaurants. Newly
onstructed restaurants 8,000 square feet or greater and with

service water heaters rated 75,000 Btu/h or greater installed a solar
ater-heating system with a minimum solar savings fraction of 0.15
r meet one of the exceptions.

42



I APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR esc
~5.203.1.1.3 Functional Areas where Compliance with

I
Residential Lighting Standards is required. For newly
constructed high-rise residential dwelling units and hotel and motel

uest rooms, indoor lighting complies with the applicable
equirements in Appendix A4 Residential Voluntary Measures,
ivision A4.2 - Energy Efficiency, Section A4.203.1.1.3. For
dditions and alterations to high-rise residential dwelling units and

hotel and motel guest rooms, indoor lighting complies with the
applicable requirements in Appendix A4 Residential Voluntary
Measures, Division A4.2 - Energy Efficiency, Section A4.204.1.1.1.

5.203.1.2.1 Tier 1. For building projects that include indoor lighting
or mechanical systems, but not both, the Energy Budget isno
greater than 95 percent of the Title 24, Part 6 Energy Budget for the
Proposed Design Building. For building projects that include indoor
lighting and mechanical systems, the Energy Budget is no greater
han 90 percent of the Title 24, Part 6 Energy Budget for the

Pro osed Desi n Building.
A5.203.1.2.2 Tier 2. For building projects that include indoor
lighting or mechanical systems, but not both, the Energy Budget is
no greater than 90 percent of the Title 24, Part 6 Energy Budget for
the Proposed Design Building. For building projects that include
indoor lighting and mechanical systems, the Energy Budget is no
greater than 85 percent of the Title 24, Part 6 Energy Budget for the
Pro osed Design Buildin .
i££rd'~W:il~I~~jE.!l&'r"
A5.211.1 On-site renewable energy. Use on-site renewable
energy for at least 1 percent of the electrical service overcurrent
protection device rating calculated in accordance with the 2013Los
Angeles Electrical Code or 1 'r<:VV, whichever is greater, in addition to
the electrical demand requ ired to meet 1 percent of natural gas and
propane use calculated in accordance with the 2013Los Angeles
Plumbing Code.

A5.211.1.1 Documentation. Calculate renewable on-site system
to meet the requirements of
Section A5.211.1. Factor in net-metering, if offered by local utility,
on an annual basis.

A5.211.3 Green power. Participate in the local utility's renewable
energy portfolio program that provides a minimum of 50 percent
electrical power from renewable sources. Maintain documentation
through utility billings.

,5.211.1 Space for Future Electrical Solar System Installation IN].

I
comPIY with Section 110.10 of the California Energy Code.
5.211.1.1 Prewiring for Future Electrical Solar System IN]. Install
fonduit from the building roof, eave, or other locations approved by
I~heDepartment to the electrical service equipment. The conduit
Ishall be labeled as per the Los Angeles Fire Department
requirements.

Exception: Buildings not required to provide a solar zone
per Section 110.10 of the California Energy Code.

VOLUNTARY
CALGreen CALGreen

MA!"IQA TORY Tier 1 Tier 2

43

[gI'

o 0

[gI'



VOLUNTARY

APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR BSC
CALGreen CALGreen

MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2
5.212.1 Elevators and escalators. In buildings with more than

one elevator or two escalators, provide systems and controls to
reduce the energy demand of elevators and escalators as follows.
Document systems operation and controls in the project
specifications and commissioning plan.
5.212.1.1 Elevators. Traction elevators shall have a regenerative

drive system that feeds electrical power back into the building grid
when the elevator is in motion.

A5.212.1.1.1 Car lights and fan. A parked elevator shall turn
off its car lights and fan automatically until the elevator is
called for use.

A5.212.1.2 Escalators. An escalator shall have a VWF motor drive
system that is fully regenerative when the escalator is in motion.

o 0

o 0

o 0

5.303.1 Meters. Separate meters shall be installed for the uses
described in Sections 5.303.1.1 and 5.303.1.2.

5.303.1.1 New buildings or additions in excess of 50,000
square feet. Separate submeters shall be installed as follows:

1. For each individual leased, rented or other tenant space
within the building projected to consume more than 100
gal/day.

2. Where separate submeters for individual building tenants
are unfeasible, for water supplied to the following
subsystems:
a. Makeup water for cooling towers where flow through is
greater than 500 gpm (30 Lis)
b. Makeup water for evaporative coolers greater than 6 gpm
(0.04 Lis)
c. Steam and hot-water boilers with energy input more than
500,000 Btu/h (147 kW)

5.303.1.2 Excess consumption. A separate submeter or metering
device shall be provided within a new building or within an addition
that is projected to consume more than 1,000 gal/day (3800 Llday).
5.303.2 Water Reduction. Plumbing fixtures shall meet the
maximum flow rate values shown in Table 5.303.2.3

Exception: Buildings that demonstrate 20-percent overall water
use reduction. In this case, a calculation demonstrating a 20-
percent reduction in the building "water use baseline," as
established in Table 5.303.2.2 shall be provided.
5.303.2.1 Areas of additions or alterations. For those
occupancies within the authority of the California Building
Standards Commission as specified in Section 103, the
provisions of Section 5.303.2 and Section 5.303.3 shall apply to
new fixtures in additions or areas of alterations to the building.

44



VOLUNTARY
CALGreen CALGreen

1-----;;-;;;-;;~~A"'Pc'_;P"'L'-'IC'_':A:_'T"-IO~N~C.:.:H:=Ec::C:._;K=L:..::IS'_'T-'F-'O:.::.R:.,;B=-S=-C;:_;-;--;-_--t:::M::cA::.:N=DATORY Tier 1 Tier 2
AS.303.2.3.1 Tier 1 - 30-percent savings. A schedule of
plumbing fixtures and fixture fittings that will reduce the overall
use of potable water within the building by 30 percent shall be
provided.
AS.303.2.3.2 Tier 2 - 35-percent savings. A schedule of
plumbing fixtures and fixture fittings that will reduce the overall
use of potable water within the building by 35 percent shall be
provided.
AS.303.2.3.3 Forty-percent percent savings. A schedule of
plumbing fixtures and fixture fittings that will reduce the overall
use of potable water within the building by 40 percent shall be
provided. (Calculate savings by Water Use Worksheets)
AS.303.2.3.4 Nonpotable water systems for indoor use.
Utilizing nonpotable water systems (such as captured
rainwater, treated graywater, and recycled water) intended to
supply water closets, urinals, and other allowed sues, may be
used in the calculations demonstrating the 30, 35 or 40 percent
reduction. The non potable water systems shall comply with the
current edition of the Los Angeles Plumbing Code.

D D

D D

S.303.3 Water conserving plumbing fixtures and fittings.
Plumbing fixtures (water closets and urinals) and fittings (faucets
and showerheads) shall comply with the following:

5.303.3.1 Water closets. The effective flush volume of all water
closets shall not exceed 1.2B gallons per flush. Tank-type water
closets shall be certified to the performance criteria of the U.S
EPA WaterSense Specification for Tank-Type Toilets.

Note: The effective flush volume of dual flush toilets is defined
as the composite, average flush volume of two reduced flushes
and one full flush.

5.303.3.2 Urinals. The effective flush volume of urinals shall not
exceed 0.5 gallons per flush.
5.303.3.3 Showerheads.

5.303.3.3.1 Single Showerhead. Showerheads shall have a
maximum flow rate of not more than 2.0 gallons per minute at
BOpsi. Showerheads shall be certified to the performance
criteria of the U.S EPA WaterSense Specification for
Showerheads.

5.303.3.3.2 Multiple showerheads serving one shower.
When a shower is served by more than one showerhead, the
combined flow rate of all showeheads and/or other shower '_J
outlets controlled by a single valve shall not exceed 2.0
gallons per minute at BOpsi, or the shower shall be designed
to allow only one shower outlet to be in operation at a time.

Note: A hand-held shower shall be consid"'e"'re"'d"-a"'-"sccho"'w"'e"'r."h"'ea"d"'.-'---.J ---'

45



APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR BSC
A5.303.3 Appliances.

1. Clothes washers shall have a maximum Water Factor (WF)
that will reduce the use of water.
2. Dishwashers shall meet the criteria in Section A5.303.3(2)(a)
and (b).
3. Ice makers shall be air cooled.
4. Food steamers shall be connectionless or boilerless.
5. The use and installation of water softeners shall be limited or
prohibited by local agencies.
6. Combination ovens shall not consume more than 10 gph (38
L/h) in the full operational mode.
7. Commercial pre-rinse spray valves manufactured on or after
January 1, 2006 shall function at equal to or less than 1.6 gpm
(0.10 LIs) at60 psi (414 kPa) and

a. Be capable of cleaning 60 plates in an average time of not
more than 30 seconds per plate
b. Be equipped with an integral automatic shutoff
c. Operate at static pressure of at least 30 psi (207 kPa) when
designed for a flow rate of 1.3 gpm (0.08 LIs) or less

5.303.4 Wastewater reduction. Each building shall reduce the
generation of wastewater by one of the following methods:

1. The installation of water-conserving fixtures or
2. Utilizing non potable water systems.

A5.303.5 Dual plumbing. New buildings and facilities shall be dual
lumbed for otable and rec cled water s stems.

5.303~6 Standards for plumbing fixtures and fittings. Plumbing
fixtures and fittings) shall be installed in accordance with the Los
Angeles Plumbing Code, and shall meet the applicable standards
referenced in Table 1401.1 of the Los Angeles Plumbing Code and
in Cha ter 6 of this code.

VOLUNTARY

D

CALGreen CALGreen
MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2

As applicable
[8J
[8J

D D
D D
D DD DD D
D D
D D

As applicable
[8J

5.304.1 Water budget. A water budget shall be developed for
landsca e irri alion use." liestoadditionsandaltera!ions.
5.304.2 Outdoor potable water use. For new water service or for
an addition or alteration requiring upgraded water service, separate
meters or submeters shall be installed for indoor and outdoor
potable water use for cumulative landscaped areas of at least 1,000
square feet, separate submeters shall be installed for outdoor
potable water use.
A5.304.2.1 Outdoor potable water use. For new water service not
subject to the provisions of Section 304.2, separate meters or
submeters shall be installed for outdoor potable water use for
landscaped areas of at least 500 square feet but not more than
1,000 square feet (the level at which Section 5.304.2 applies).

46

D D

D



VOLUNTARY---
CALGreen CALGreen

APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR-=B",S,-,C-;-~--;-_--+-Mc::A-"N-"D::::A-,-T,-,O::::R-,-,-Y!LJier1 Tier 2
5.304.3 Irrigation design. In new nonresidential projects with at
least 1,000 square feet of landscaped area, install irrigation
controllers and sensors which include the following criteria and meet
manufacturer's recommendations. Applies to additions and
alterations.

5.304.3.1 Irrigation controllers. Automatic irrigation system
controllers installed at the time of final inspection shall comply
with the following:

1. Controllers shall be weather- or soil moisture-based
controllers that automatically adjust irrigation in response to
changes in plants' needs as weather conditions change.

2. Weather-based controllers without integral rain sensors or
communication systems that account for local rainfall shall
have a separate wired or wireless rain sensor which connects
or communicates with the controller(s). Soil moisture-based
controllers are not reguired to have rain sensor inR.Il.L t-_

A5.304.4 Potable water reduction. Provide water efficient
landscape irrigation design that reduces by the use of potable
water.

AS.304.4.1 Tier 1 - Reduce the use of potable water to a
quantity that does not exceed 60 percent of ETo times the
landscape area.
A5.304.4.2 Tier 2 -Reduce the use of potable water to a quantity
that does not exceed 55 percent of ETo times the landscape
area.

Methods used to accomplish the requirements of this section
shall include, but not be limited to, the items listed in A5.304.4.

A5.304.4.3 Verification of compliance. A calculation
demonstrating the applicable potable water use reduction required

fCb;Y~;;;,t,;;h~is;;,sc;;e-,;:ctC'i07n:..;s"ih:.::a::.:ll-,b'7ec..rp"-r,,;ov,",i::.de,,,d::':·~~~~;--_-;-_~;--;--_++ I .__
AS.304.S Potable water elimination. Provide a water efficient
landscape irrigation design that eliminates the use of potable water
beyond the initial requirements for plant installation and
establishment.
Methods used to accomplish the requirements of this section shall
include, but not be limited to, the items listed in Section A5.304.4.
AS.304.6 Restoration of areas disturbed by c-o-n-s"'"t-ru-c"7ti'""o-n-.--+-----1---- .._--..._.---
Restore all areas disturbed during construction by planting with
local native and/or noninvasive vegetation.

o 0

1---

applicable
~

o 0
AS.104.7 Previously developed sites. On previously developed or
graded sites, restore or protect ~Ieast 50 percent of the site area 0 0
AS.304.8 Graywater irrigation systeC::m~.l"'n!:.st:::a""II"'g"'rac.:y':':w.::a7te'"'r::.:c:::oT.lle:::c:7ti::.o"'n+----+--'='---f--'="----1
svstam for onsite subsurface irrinaflon 0 0

o
o

AS.30S.1 Nonpotable water systems. Nonpotable water systems
for indoor and outdoor use shall comply with the current edition of
the Los Angeles Plumbing Code.
AS.30S.2 Irrigation systems. Irrigation systems regulated by a
local water efficient landscape ordinance or by the California
Department of Water Resources Model Water Efficient Landscape
Ordinance MWELO shall use rec cled water.

o
o

47



APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR BSC

AS.40S.1 Regional materials. Select building materials or products
for permanent installation on the project that have been harvested
or manufactured in California or within 500 rniles of the project site,
meeting the criteria listed in Section A5.405.1.

AS.40S.2 Bio-based materials. Select bio-based building materials , '
per Section A5.4052.1 or A5.405.2.2.

AS.40S.2.1 Certified wood products. Certified wood is an
important component of green building strategies and the
California Building Standards Commission will continue to
develop a standard through the next code cycle.

AS.40S.2.2 Rapidly renewable materials. Use materials made
from plants harvested within a ten-year cycle for at least 2.5 percent
of total materia Is value, based on estimated cost.
AS.40S.3 Reused materials. Use salvaged, refurbished, refinished
or reused materials for at least 5 percent of the total value, based
on estimated cost of materials on the project.
AS.40S.4 Recycled content. Use materials, equivalent in
performance to virgin materials, with a total (combined) recycled
content value (RCV) of:

Tier 1. The RCV shall not be less than 10 percent of the total
material cost of the project.
Tier 2. The RCV shall not be less than 15 percent of the total
material cost of the project.

Note: Use the equations in the subsections for calculating total
materials cost, recycled content, RCV of materials and assemblies,
and total RCV.

~

48

CALGreen CALGreen
MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2

VOLUNTARY

o o

o

o

o

o

o

o

o

o



APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR BSC
A5.405.5 Cement and concrete. Use cement and concrete made
with recycled products and complying with the following sections:

A5.405.5.1 Cement. Cement shall comply with one of the
following standards:

1. Portland cement shall meet ASTM C 150.
2. Blended hydraulic cement shall meet ASTM C 595.
3. Other Hydraulic Cements shall meet ASTM C 1157.

A5.405.5.2 Concrete. Unless otherwise directed by the Engineer
of Record, use concrete manufactured with cementitious
materials in accordance with Sections A5.405.5.2.1 and
A5.405.5.2.1.1, as approved by the department.

A5.405.5.2.1 Supplementary cementitious materials
(SCMs). Use concrete made with one or more of the SCMs
listed in Section A5.405.5.2.1.

A5.405.5.2.1.1 Mix design equation. Use any combination
of one or more SCMs, satisfying Equation A4.5-14.

Exception: Minimums in mix designs approved by the
Engineer of Record may be lower where high early
strength is needed.

A5.405.5.3 Additional means of compliance. Any of the
following measures shall be permitted to be employed for the
production of cement or concrete, depending on their availability
and suttability, in conjunction with Section A5.405.5.2.

A5.405.5.3.1 Cement. The following measures may be used in
the manufacture of cement.

A5.405.5.3.1.1 Alternative fuels. Where permitted by state
or local air quality standards.
A5.405.5.3.1.2 Alternative power. Alternate electric power
generated at the cement plant and/or green power
purchased from the utility meeting the requirements of
Section A5.211.

A5.405.5.3.2 Concrete. The following measures may be used
in the manufacture of concrete,

A5.405.5.3.2.1 Alternative energy. Renewable or
alternative energy meeting the requirements of Section
A5.211.
A5.405.5.3.2.2 Recycled aggregates. Concrete made with
one or more of the material s listed in Section
A5.405.5.3.2.2.
A5.405.5.3.2.3 Mixing water. Water recycled by the local
water purveyor or water reclaimed from manufacturing
processes and conforming to ASTM C1602.
A5.405.5.3.2.4 High strength concrete. Concrete elements
designed to reduce their total size compared to standard
3,000 psi concrete, as approved by the Engineer of Record.

VOLUNTARY'
CALGreen CALGreen

MANDA TORY Tier 1 Tier 2

o 0

o 0

o 0

o 0

o 0

o 0

o 0

o 0

oA5.406.1 Choice of materials. Compared to other products in a
given category, choose materials from the following for a minimum
of 5 percent of the total value, based on estimated cost of materials i
on the project. I
A5.406.1.2 Reduced maintenance. Select materials that require I
little, if any, finishing. I____ ~ -L _

49

o

o



VOLUNTARY
CALGreen CALGreen

MANDA TORY Tier 1 Tier 2APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR esc
'1~t"'''''''''''''''''B'l'iIl"''~tiI'Iiii~'IllI!l1''diH'iIl!".' ,,.,.~lillielllRe$,Jnl.q_gJ!$~,["La, ",,1]
5.407.1 Weather protection. Provide a weather-resistant exterior
wall and foundation envelope as required by Los Angeles Building
Code Section 1403.2 and California Energy Code Section 150,
manufacturers installation instructions or local ordinance,
whichever is more strinqent."
5.407.2 Moisture control. Employ moisture control measures by
the following methods;

5.407.2.1 Sprinklers. Prevent irrigation spray on structures,
5.407.2.2 Entries and openings. Design exterior entries and
o enings to revent water intrusion into buildin s.

5.40S.1 Construction waste management. Comply with Section
66.32 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code.

5.40S.3 Excavated soil and land clearing debris. 100 percent of
trees, stumps, rocks and associated vegetation and soils resulting
primarily from land clearing shall be reused or recycled.
Exception: Reuse, either on-or off-site, of vegetation or soil
contaminated b disease or est infestation.
A5.40S.3.1 Enhanced construction waste reduction-Tier 1.
Divert to recycle or salvage at least 65% of nonhazardous
construction and demolition waste generated at the site.

A5.40S.3.1.1 Enhanced construction waste reduction-Tier
2. Divert to recycle or salvage at least 80% of nonhazardous
construction and demolition waste generated at the site.
A5.40S.3.1.2 Verification of compliance. A copy of the
completed waste management report or documentation of
certification of the waste management company utilized shall be
provided.

Exceptions:
1. Excavated soil and land-clearing debris
2. Alternate waste reduction methods developed by

working with local agencies if diversion or recycle
facilities capable of compliance with this item do not
exist

3. Demolition waste meeting local ordinance or
calculated in consideration of local recycling facilities
and markets.

50



-~OLUNTARyl
-CALGreen CALGreen

MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR SSC
o 0AS.409.1 General. Life cycle assessment shall be ISO 14044

compliant. The service life of the building and materials assemblies
shall not be less than 60 years.
AS.409.2 Whole building life cycle assessment. Conduct a whole
building life assessment, including operating energy, showing that
the building project achieves at least a 10 percent improvement for
at least three of the impacts listed in Section A5.409.2.2, one of
which shall be climate change, compared to a reference building.
AS,409.3 Materials and system assemblies. If whole building
analysis of the project is not elected, select a minimum of 50% of
materials or assemblies based on life cycle assessment of at least
three for the impacts listed in Section A5.409.2.2, one of which shall
be climate change.
AS.409.4 Substitution for prescriptive standards. Performance of
a life cycle assessment completed in accordance wlth Section
A5.409.2 may be substituted for other prescriptive provisions of
Division A5.4, including those made mandatory through local
adoption of Tier 1 or Tier 2 in Division A5.6.
AS.409.5 Verification of compliance. Documentation of
compliance shall be provided as follows:

1. The assessment is performed in accordance with ISO 14044.
2. The project meets the requirements of other parts of Title 24.
3. A copy of the analysis shall be made available to the
enforcement authority.
4. A copy of the analysis and any maintenance or training

recommendations shall be included in the operation and
maintenance manua I.

See notes for available tools.

o 0

o 0

o 0

o 0o 0o 0

o 0

5.410.1 Recycling by occupants. Provide readily accessible areas
that serve the entire building and are identified for the depositing,
storage and collection of nonhazardous materials for recycling3

5.410.2 Commissioning. [N] For new buildings 10,000 square feet
and over, building commissioning for all building systems covered by
Title 24, Part 6, process systems and renewable energy systems shall
be included in the design and construction processes of the building
project. Commissioning requirements shall include items listed in
Section 5.410.2.

Exceptions:
1. Dry storage warehouses of any size
2. Areas under 10,000 square feet used for offices or other
conditioned accessory spaces within dry storage warehouses
3. Tenant improvements under 10,000 square feet as
described in Section 303.1.1.

5.410.2.1 Owner's Project Requirements (OPR). [N] Documented
before the design phase of the project be.gins the aPR shall include I
items listed in Section 5.410.4.

51



APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR BSC
CALGreen CALGreen

MANDA TORY Tier 1 Tier 2

VOLUNTARY

5.410.2.2 Basis of Design (BOD). IN) A written explanation of
how the design of the building systems meets the OPR shall be
completed at the design phase of the building project to cover the
systems listed in Section 5.410.2.2.
5.410.2.3 Commissioning plan. IN) A commissioning plan
describing how the project will be commissioned shall include
items listed in Section 5.410.2.3.
5.410.2.4 IN) Functional performance testing shall demonstrate
the correct installation and operation of each component, system
and system-to-system interface in accordance with the approved
plans and specifications.
5.410.2.5 Documentation and training. IN) A Systems manual
and systems operations training are required.

5.410.2.5.1 Systems manual. IN) The systems manual shall
be delivered to the building owner or representative and
facilities operator and shall include the items listed in Section
5.410.2.5.1.
5.410.2.5.2 Systems operations training. IN) A program for
training of the appropriate maintenance staff for each
equipment type and/or system shall be developed and shall
include items listed in Section 5.410.2.5.2.

5.410.2.6 Commissioning report. IN) A report of commissioning
process activities undertaken through the design and construction
phases of the building project shall be completed and provided to
the owner or representative.

5.410.4 Testing and adjusting. Testing and adjusting of systems
shall be required for buildings less than 10,000 square feet. Applies
to new systems serving additions or alterations.

5.410.4.2 Systems. Develop a written plan of procedures for
testing and adjusting systems. Systems to be included for testing
and adjusting shall include, as applicable to the project, the
systems listed in Section 5.410.4.2.
5.410.4.3 Procedures. Perform testing and adjusting procedures
in accordance with applicable standards on each system as
determined by the department.

5.410.4.3.1 HVAC balancing. Before a new space-conditioning
system serving a building or space is operated for normal use,
balance in accordance with the procedures defined by national
standards listed in Section 5.410.4.3.1 or as approved by the
enforci ng agency.

5.410.4.4 Reporting. After completion of testing, adjusting and
balancing, provide a final report of testing signed by the individual
responsible for performing these services.
5.410.4.5 Operation and maintenance manual. Provide the
building owner with detailed operating and maintenance
instructions and copies of guaranties/warranties for each system
prior to final inspection.

5.410.4.5.1 Inspections and reports. Include a copy of all
inspection verifications and reports required by the
department.

52



VOLUNTARY'·~
CALGreen CAL-Green

MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR BSC

D

S.S03.1 Install only a direct-vent sealed-combustion gas or sealed
wood-burning fireplace or a sealed wood stove and refer to residential
requirements in the California Energy Code, Title 24, Part 6,
Subchapter 7, Section 150.

S.S03.1.1 Woodstoves. Wood stoves shall comply with US EPA
Phase II emission limits.

As applicable

AS.S04.1 Indoor air quality (IAQ) during construction. Maintain
IAQ as provided in Sections A5.504.1.1 and A5.504.1.2.

AS.S04.1.1 Temporary ventilation. Provide temporary
ventilation during construction in accordance with Section 121 of
the California Energy Code, CCR, Title 24, Part 6 and Chapter 4
of CCR, Title 8 and as listed in Items 1 and 2 in Section
A5.504.1.2.
AS.S04.1.2 AdditionallAQ measures. Employ additional
measures as listed in Items 1 through 5 in Section A5.504.1.3.
S.S04.1.3 Temporary ventilation. If the HVAC system is used
during construction, use return air filters with a MERV of 8, based
on ASHRAE 52.2-1999, or an average efficiency of 30% based
on ASHRAE 52.1-1992. Replace all filters immediately prior to
occupancy. Applies to additions or alterations.

D

D D

AS.S04.2IAQ postconstruction. Flush out the building per Section
A5.504.2 prior to occupancy or if the building is occupied.

AS.S04.2.1 IAQ Testing. A testing alternative may be employed
after all interior finishes have been installed, using testing
protocols recognized by the United State Environmental
Protection Agency (U.S. EPA) and in accordance with Section
A5.504.2.1.2. Retest as required in Section A5.504.2.1.3.

AS.S04.2.1.1 Maximum levels of contaminants. Allowable
levels of contaminant concentrations measured by testing shall
not exceed the follow'lng:

1. Carbon Monoxide (CO): 9 parts per million, not to exceed
outdoor levels by 2 parts per million;
2. Formaldehyde: 27 parts per billion;
3. Particulates (PM10): 50 micrograms per cubic meter;
4. 4-Phenylcyclohexene (4-PCH): 6.5 micrograms per cubic
meter; and
5. Total Volatile Organic Compounds (1VOC): 300
micrograms per cubic meter.

AS.S04.2.1.2 Test protocols. Testing of indoor air quality
should include the elements listed in Items 1 through 4.
AS.S04.2.1.3 Noncomplying building areas, For each
sampling area of the building exceeding the maximum
concentrations specified in Section A5.504.2.1.1, flush out with
outside air and retest samples taken from the same area.
Repeat the procedures until testing demonstrates compliance.

D
D D

1<

As As
applicable applicable

D D
D D
D D
D D
D D
D D
D D

i

...J

53



VOLUNTARY
CALGreen CALGreen

MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR esc
5.504.3 Covering of duct openings and protection of mechanical
equipment during construction. At the time of rough installation and
during storage on the construction site and until final startup of the
heating, cooling and ventilating equipment, all duct and other related
air distribution component openings shall be covered with tape,
plastic, sheetmetal or other methods acceptable to the department to
reduce the amount of dust, water and debris which may enter the
system.
5.504.4 Finish material pollutant control. Finish materials shall
comply with Sections 5.504.4.1 through 5.504.4.4.

5.504.4.1 Adhesives, sealants, caulks. Adhesives and sealants
used on the project shall meet the requirements of the following
standards:

1. Adhesives, adhesive bonding primers, adhesive primers,
sealants, sealant primers and caulks shall comply with local or
regional air pollution control or air quality management district
rules where applicable or SeAQMD Rule 1168 vae limits, as
shown in Tables 5.504.4.1 and 5.504.4.2.
2. Aerosol adhesives and smaller unit sizes of adhesives and
sealant or caulking compounds (in units of product, less
packaging, which do not weigh more than one pound and do
not consist of more than 16 fluid ounces) shall comply with
statewide vae standards and other requirements, including
prohibitions on use of certain toxic compounds, of California
Code of Regulations, Title 17, commencing with Section
94507.

54



CALGreen CALGreen
APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR SSC MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2

5.504.4.3 Paints and coatings. Architectural paints and coatings I2J
shall comply with Table 5.504.4.3 unless more stringent local
limits apply.

5.504.4.3.1 Aerosol paints and coatings. Aerosol paints and I2J
coatings shall meet the Product- Weighted MIR Limits for ROC
in Section 94522(a)(3) and other requirements, including
prohibitions on use of certain toxic compounds and ozone
depleting substances (CCR, Title 17, Section 94520 et seq).
5.504.4.3.2 Verification. Verification of compliance with this I2J
section shall be provided at the request of the department.

5.504.4.4 Carpet systems. All carpet installed in the building
interior shall meet the testing and product requirements of one of I2J
the standards listed in Section 5.504.4.4.

5.504.4.4.1 Carpet cushion. All carpet cushion installed in the
building interior shall meet the requirements of the Carpet and
Rug Institute's Green Label program.
5.504.4.4.2 Carpet adhesive. All carpet adhesive shall meet
the requirements of Table 5.504.4.1.

5.504.4.5 Composite wood products. Hardwood plywood,
particleboard and medium density fiberboard composite wood
products used on the interior or exterior of the building shall meet
the requirements for formaldehyde as specified in Table 5.504.4.

A5.504.4.5.1 No added formaldehyde. Use composite wood 0 0
products approved by the ARB as no-added formaldehyde (NAF)
based resins or ultra-low emitting formaldehyde (ULEF) resins.
5.504.4.5.3 Documentation. Verification of compliance with I2J
this section shall be provided as requested by the department. II 0 0
Documentation shall include at least one of the following. As applicable

1. Product certifications and specifications
2. Chain of custody certifications I2J
3. Product labeled and invoiced as meeting the Composite I2J

Wood Products regulation (see CCR, Title 17, Section I2J
93120, et seq.)

4. Exterior grade products marked as meeting the PS-1 or
PS-2 standards of the Engineered Wood Association, the I2J
Australian AS/NZS 2269 or European 636 3S standards.
5. Other methods acceptable to the department. I2J

55

VOLUNTARY'



VOLUNTARY
CALGreen CALGreen

1--=-=::-;-c~~A7.P,-,PL",I~C",Ac:.T,-,I0C'-N,-C:::H,-"E=:C:::K",L",I"=ST~F-=0C-'R,-,,B~S,-=C'c--~=-_-+,M:.::A,-"N,,-:;DATORY Tier 1 Tier 2
5.504.4.6 Resilient flooring systems. Comply with the voc- I:8l
emission limits defined in the 2009 CHPS criteria and listed on its
High Performance Products Database; products compliant with
CHPS criteria certified under the Greenguard Children & Schools
program; certified under the FloorScore program of the Resilient
Floor Covering Institute; or meet California Department of Public
Health 2010 Specification 01350.

A5.504.4.6.1 Verification of compliance. Documentation
shall be provided verifying that resilient flooring materials meet
the pollutant emission limits.

A5.504.4.7 Resilient flooring systems, Tier 1. For 80 percent of
floor area receiving resilient flooring, install resilient flooring
complying with the VaC-emission limits defined in the 2009
CHPS criteria and listed on its High Performance Products.
Database; products compliant with CHPS criteria certified under
the Greenguard Children & Schools program; certified under the
FloorScore program of the Resilient Floor Covering Institute; or
meet California Department of Public Health 2010 Specification
01350.

A5.504.4.7.1 Resilient flooring systems, Tier 2. For 100
percent of floor area to scheduled to receive resilient flooring,
install resilient flooring complying with the voc-emlseion limits
defined in the 2009 CHPS criteria and listed on its High
Performance Products Database; products compliant with
CHPS criteria certified under the Greenguard Children &
Schools program; certified under the FloorScore program of
the Resilient Floor Covering Institute; or meet California
Department of Public Health 2010 Specification 01350.
A5.504.4.7.2 Verification of compliance. Documentation
shall be provided verifying that resilient flooring materials meet
the pollutant emission limits.

A5.504.4.8 Thermal insulation, Tier 1. Comply with the
standards listed in Items 1 through 3.

A5.504.4.8.1 Thermal insulation, Tier 2. Install thermal
insulation which complies with Tier 1 plus does not contain any
added formaldehyde.
A5.504.4.8.2 Verification of compliance. Documentation
shall be provided verifying that thermal insulation materials
meet the pollutant emission limits.

A5.504.4.9 Acoustical ceilings and wall panels. Comply with
Chapter 8 in Title 24, Part 2 and with the vac- emission limits
defined in the 2009 CHPS criteria and listed on its High
Performance Products Database.

A5.504.4.9.1 Verification of compliance. Documentation
shall be provided verifying that acoustical finish materials meet
the pollutant emission limits.

o 0

o 0

56



VOLUNTARY'
CALGreen CALGreen

MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR SSC
AS.S04.S Hazardous particulates and chemical pollutants.
Minimize and control pollutant entry into buildings and cross-
contamination of regularly occupied areas.

AS.S04.S.1 Entryway systems. Install permanent entryway
systems measuring at least six feet in the primary direction of
travel to capture dirt and particulates at entryways directly
connected to the outdoors as listed in Items 1 through 3 in
Section A5.504.5.1.
AS.S04.S.2 Isolation of pollutant sources. In rooms where
activities produce hazardous fumes or chemicals, exhaust them
and isolate them from their adjacent rooms as listed in Items 1
through 3 in Section A5.504.5.2.
S.S04.S.3 Filters. In mechanically ventilated buildings, provide
regularly occupied areas of the building with air filtration media
for outside and return air that provides at least a MERV of 8.
MERV 8 filters shall be installed prior to occupancy, and
recommendations for maintenance with filters of the same value
shall be included in the operation and maintenance manual.

Exception:
1. An ASH RAE 1O-percent to 15-percent efficiency filter
shall be permitted for an HVAC unit meeting the 2013
California Energy Code having 60,000 Btu/h or less capacity
per fan coil, if the energy use of the air delivery system is
0.4 W/cfm or less at design air flow.
2. Existing mechanical equipment

AS.504.S.3.1 Filters, Tier 1.ln mechanically ventilated buildings,
provide regularly occupied areas of the building with air filtration
media for outside and return air prior to occupancy that provides
at least a MERV of 11.
AS.S04.S.3.1.1 Filters, Tier 2.ln mechanically ventilated
buildings, provide regularly occupied areas of the building with air
filtration media for outside and return air prior to occupancy that
provides at least a MERV of 13.

o 0

o 0

o

o

5.S04.7 Environmental tobacco smoke (ETS) control. Prohibit
smoking within 25 feet of building entries, outdoor air intakes and
operable windows where outdoor areas are provided for smoking
and within the building as already prohibited by other laws or
regulations; or as enforced by ordinances, regulations or policies
of the City.

5.S06.1 Outside air delivery. For mechanically or naturally
ventilated spaces in buildings, meet the minimum requirements of
Section 121 of the California Energy Code and Chapter 4 of CCR,
Title 8 or the applicable local code, whichever is more strinqent,"
S.S06.2 Carbon dioxide (C02) monitoring. For buildings equipped
with demand control ventilation, CO2 sensors and ventilation
controls shall be specified and installed in accordance with the
re uirements of the California Enemv Code, CCR Section 121 c .3

57



CALGreen CALGreen
MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR BSC

",.tW.·

A5.507.1 Lighting and thermal comfort controls. Provide
controls in the workplace as described in Sections A5.507.1.1 and
A5.507.1.2.

A5.507.1.1 Single-occupant spaces. Provide individual controls
that meet energy use requirements in the 2007 California Energy
Code by Sections A5.507.1.1.1 and A5.507.1.1.2.

A5.507.1.1.1 Lighting. Provide individual task lighting and/or
daylighting controls for at least 90 percent of the building
occupants.
A5.507.1.1.2 Thermal comfort. Provide individual thermal
comfort controls for at least 50 percent of the building
occupants by Items 1 and 2 in Section A5.507.1.1.2.

A5.507.1.2 Multi-occupant spaces. Provide lighting and thermal
comfort system controls for all shared multi-occupant spaces.

VOLUNTARY

o

o

o
o

o

o
o

o
A5.507.2 Daylight. Provide daylit spaces as required for toplighting
and sidelighting in the California Energy Code. In constructing a
design, consider Items 1 through 4 in Section A5.507.3.
5.507.4 Acoustical control. Employ building assemblies and
components with STC values determined in accordance with ASTM
E 90 and ASTM E 413 or OITC determined in accordance with
ASTM E 1332, using either the prescriptive or performance method
in Section 5.507.4.1 or 5.507.4.2.

5.507.4.1 Exterior noise transmission, prescriptive method.
Wall and floor-ceiling assemblies exposed to the noise source
.making up the building envelope shall have exterior wall and roof
ceiling assemblies meeting a composite STC rating of at least 50
or a composite OITC rating of no less than 40 with exterior
windows of a minimum STC of 40 or OITC of 30 in the locations
described in Items 1 and 2.

5.507.4.1.1 Noise exposure where noise contours are not
readily available. Buildings exposed to a noise level of 65 dB
40-1 Hr during any hour of operation shall have exterior wall
and roof-ceiling assemblies exposed to the noise source
meeting a composite STC rating of at least 45 (or OITC 35),
with exterior windows of a minimum STC of 40 (or OITC
30).

5.507.4.2 Performance method. For buildings located as
defined in Sections A5.507.4.1 or A5.507.4.1.1, wall and roof-
ceiling assemblies making up the building envelope shall be
constructed to provide an interior noise environment attributable
to exterior sources that does not exceed an hourly equivalent
noise level (40-1 Hr) of 50 dBA in occupied areas during any hour
of operation.

5.507.4.2.1 Site features. Exterior features such as sound
walls or earth berms may be utilized as appropriate to the
project to mitigate sound migration to the interior.
5.507.4.2.1 Documentation of compliance. An acoustical
analysis documenting complying interior sound levels shall be
prepared by personnel approved by the architect or engineer
of record.

or

58

o o



VOLUNTARY
CALGreen CALGreen

MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR BSC
5.507.4.3 Interior sound transmission. Wall and floor-ceiling
assemblies separating tenant spaces and tenant spaces and

ublic shall have an STC of at least 40.

5.508.1 Ozone depletion and global warming reductions.
Installations of HVAC, refrigeration and fire suppression equipment
shall comply with Sections 5.508.1.1 and 5.508.1.2.

5.508.1.1 CFCs. Install HVAC and refrigeration equipment that
does not contain CFCs.3

5.508.1.2 Halons. Install fire suppression equipment that does
not contain Halons.'
A5.508.1.3 Hydrochlorofluorocarbons (HCFCs).lnstall HVAC
and refrigeration equipment that does not contain HCFCs.
A5.50B.1.4 Hydrofluorocarbons (HFCs). Install HVAC
complying with either of the following:

1. Install HVAC, refrigeration and fire suppression equipment
that do not contain HFCs or that do not contain HFCs with a
global warming potential greater than 150.

2. Install HVAC and refrigeration equipment that limit the use of
HFC refrigerant through the use of a secondary heat transfer
fluid with a global warming potential no greater than 1.

5.50B.2 Supermarket refrigerant leak reduction. New commercial
refrigeration systems shall comply with the provisions of this section
when installed in retail food stores 8,000 square feet or more
conditioned areas, and that utilize either refrigerated display cases, or
walk-in coolers or freezers connected to remote compressor units or
condensing units. The leak reduction measures apply to refrigeration
systems containing high-global-warming potential (high-GWP)
refrigerants with a GWP of 150 or greater. New refrigeration systems
include both new facilities and the replacement of existing
refrigeration systems in existing facilities.

Exception: Refrigeration systems containing low-global warming
potential (Iow-GWP) refrigerant with a GWP value less than 150
are not subject to this section. Low-GWP refrigerants are
nonozone-depleting refrigerants that include ammonia, carbon
dioxide (C02) and potentially other refrigerants.-------------'--------~.

As applicable
[gj

[gj

o o

o o

o o,
As applicable

59



~-
VOLUNTARY'

CALGreen CALGreen
APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR SSC MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2

5.508.2.1 Refrigerant piping. Piping compliant with the Los
Angeles Mechanical Code shall be installed to be accessible
for leak protection and repairs. Piping runs using threaded
pipe, copper tubing with an outside diameter (00) less than Yo
inch, flared tubing connections and short radius elbows shall
not be used in refrigerant systems except as noted below.

5.508.2.1.1 Threaded pipe. Threaded connections are
permitted at the compressor rack.
5.508.2.1.2 Copper pipe. Copper tubing with an 00 less
than Yo inch may be used in system with a refrigerant charge
of 5 pounds or less.

5.508.2.1.2.1 Anchorage. Yo inch 00 tubing shall be
securely clamped to a rigid base to keep vibration levels
below 8 mils.

5.508.2.1.3 Flared tubing connections. Double-flared tubing
connections may be used for pressure controls, valve pilot
lines and oil.

Exception: Single-flared tubing connections may be used
with a multiring seal coated with industrial sealant suitable
for use with refrigerants and tightened in accordance with
manufacturer's recommendations.

5.508.2.1.4 Elbows. Short radius elbows are only permitted
where space limitations prohibit use of long radius elbows.

5.508.2.2 Valves. Valves and fittings shall comply with the
California Mechanical Code and as follows.

5.508.2.2.1 Pressure relief valves. For vessels containing
high-GWP refrigerant, a rupture disc shall be installed in the
space between the rupture disc and the relief valve inlet to
indicate a disc rupture or discharge of the relief valve.

5.508.2.2.1.1 Pressure detection. Pressure gauge,
pressure transducer or other device shall be installed in
the space between the rupture disc and the relief valve
inlet to indicate a disc rupture or discharge of the relief
valve.

5.508.2.2.2 Access valves. Only Schrader access valves
with a brass or steel body are permitted for use.

5.508.2.2.2.1 Valve caps. For systems with a refrigerant
charge of 5 pounds or more, valve caps shall be brass or
steel and not plastic.
5.508.2.2.2.2 Seal caps. If designed for it, the cap shall
have a neoprene a-ring in place.

5.508.2.2.2.2.1 Chain tethers. Chain tethers to fit over
the stem are required for valves designed to have seal
caps.

Exception: Valves with seal caps that are not
removed from the valve during stem operation.

5.508.2.3 Refrigerated services cases. Refrigerated service
cases holding food products containing vinegar and salt shall
have evaporator coils or corrosion-resistant material, such as
stainless steel; or be coated to prevent corrosion from these
substances.

5.508.2.3.1 Coil coating. Consideration shall be given to the
heat transfer efficiency of coil coating to maximize energy
efficiencv. au



VOLUNTARY

APPLICATION CHECKLIST FOR BSC
5.508.2.4 Refrigerant receivers. Refrigerant receivers with
capacities greater than 200 pounds shall be fitted with a device
that indicated the level of refrigerant in the receiver.
5.508.2.5 Pressure testing. The system shall be pressure
tested during installation prior to evacuation and charging.

5.508.2.5.1 Minimum pressure. The system shall be
charged with regulated dry nitrogen and appropriate tracer
gas to bring system pressure up to 300psig minimum.
5.508.2.5.2.1 Leaks. Check the system for leaks, repair any
leaks, and retest for pressure using the same gauge.
5,508.2.5.3 Allowable pressure charge. The system shall
stand, unaltered, for 24 hours with no more than +/- one
pound pressure change from 300 psig, measure with the
same gauge.

5.508.2.3 Evacuation. The system shall be evacuated after
pressure testing and prior to charging.

5.508.2.6.1 First vacuum. Pull a system vacuum down to at
least 1000 microns +/- 50 microns), and hold for 30 minutes.
5.508.2.6.2 Second vacuum. Pull a second system vacuum
to a minimum of 500 microns and hold for 30 minutes.
5.508.2.6.3 Third vacuum. Pull a third vacuum down to a
minimum of 300 microns and hold for 24hours with a
maximum drift of 100 microns over a 24-hour er",io",d"",'---,----,m

1. Green building measures in this table ma ma jf adop
county as specified in Sec' 7.
2. Required prerequisit
3. These measures ar

CALGreen CALGreen
MANDATORY Tier 1 Tier 2

~~~=-=-l,--~a city, county, or city and

61



Sec. 106. The City Clerk shall certify to the passage of this ordinance and
have it published in accordance with Council policy, either in a daily newspaper
circulated in the City of Los Angeles or by posting for ten days in three public places
in the City of Los Angeles: one copy on the bulletin board located at the Main Street
entrance to the Los Angeles City Hall; one copy on the bulletin board located at the
Main Street entrance to the Los Angeles City Hall East; and one copy on the bulletin
board located at the Temple Street entrance to the Los Angeles County Hall of
Records.

Approved --'

I hereby certify that this ordinance was passed by
Los Angeles, at its meeting of --;

Council of the City of

By _-=- -'
Deputy

Mayor

Date :-- _
File No. _

62



M:\Real Prop_Env_Land Use\Land Use\Kim Westhoff\DBS--2013 Code
Amendment\2014 Green Building Ordinance KRW Draft.docx

63


